Bid Results - Chromebook Teacher Devices Tuesday April 8, 2025; 11:00 am

Item 1 - ThinkPad X1 2inl1 Gen 5 21LXC

Item 2: Notebook ThinkPad T16 Gen 2 AMD

Item 3: Lenovo 300e Yoga Chrome Gen 4

Item 4: Google Chrome OS Management Console License

Item 5: Yoga 7 2in1 (16" AMD)

Item 6: Lenovo Flex 3 Chromebook 15"

Item 7: Alternate Item Grouped
Synology Flashstation FS6400 -1
Enterprise Series 2.5- 24 Synology DDR4 -2

Synology Rail Kit- 1

Quantity || Item # Unit Price Total
Pyramid School Products 50 1 No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL 50 2 No Bid No Bid
1240 3 No Bid No Bid
1240 4 No Bid No Bid
100 5 No Bid No Bid
35 6 No Bid No Bid
Grouped 7 No Bid No Bid
M12 Enterprise Solutions 50 1 $1,693.64 $84,682.00
san Antonio, TX 50 2 $1,539.54 $76,977.00
1240 3 $456.81 $566,444.40
1240 4 $60.75 $75,330.00
100 5 $1,524.54 $152,454.00
35 6 No Bid No Bid
Grouped 7 $69,448.60
Tech Advanced Computers 50 1 $1,799.00 $89,950.00
Pensacola, FL 50 2 $1,669.00 $83,450.00
1240 3 No Bid No Bid
1240 4 $29.50 $36,580.00
100 5 No Bid No Bid
35 6 $389.00 $13,615.00
Grouped 7 $57,779.00
Brightcentra Inc 50 1 $1,177.50 $58,875.00
San Francisco, CA 50 2 $1,069.00 $53,450.00
1240 3 $315.75 $394,010.00
1240 4 $28.90 $35,836.00
100 5 $1,049.00 $104,900.00
35 6 $435.00 $15,225.00
Grouped 7 $49,211.00




Virtucom 50 1 $1,239.00 $61,950.00
Peachtree Corners, GA 50 2 $1,125.00 $56,250.00
1240 3 $329.00 $407,960.00
1240 4 $30.00 $37,200.00
100 5 $1,118.00 $111,800.00
35 6 $465.00 $16,275.00
Grouped 7 $55,526.00
Vivacity Tech 50 1 No Bid No Bid
st Paul, MN 50 2 No Bid No Bid
1240 3 $265.00 $328,600.00
1240 4 $30.00 $37,200.00
100 5 No Bid No Bid
35 6 No Bid No Bid
Grouped 7 No Bid No Bid
CDW Government LLC 50 1 No Bid No Bid
Vernon Hills, IL 50 2 No Bid No Bid
1240 3 $288.00 $357,120.00
1240 4 $29.65 $36,766.00
100 5 No Bid No Bid
35 6 No Bid No Bid
Grouped 7 No Bid No Bid
SHI 50 1 $1,241.00 $62,050.00
Somerset, NJ 50 2 $1,128.00 $56,400.00
1240 3 $338.00 $419,120.00
1240 4 $29.75 $36,890.00
100 5 $1,117.00 $111,700.00
35 6 No Bid No Bid
Grouped 7 $56,425.00
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