
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

S 216 9.72 2,099.52 3.57 771.12 4.30 928.80 3.20 691.20 5.79 1,250.64 8.00 1,728.00 5.33 1,151.28

M 360 9.72 3,499.20 3.57 1,285.20 4.30 1,548.00 3.20 1,152.00 5.79 2,084.40 8.00 2,880.00 5.33 1,918.80

L 216 9.72 2,099.52 3.57 771.12 4.30 928.80 3.20 691.20 5.79 1,250.64 8.00 1,728.00 5.33 1,151.28

XL 72 9.72 699.84 3.57 257.04 4.30 309.60 3.20 230.40 5.79 416.88 8.00 576.00 5.33 383.76

S 384 14.40 5,529.60 5.97 2,292.48 6.27 2,407.68 5.70 2,188.80 7.60 2,918.40 11.00 4,224.00 9.73 3,736.32

M 336 14.40 4,838.40 5.97 2,005.92 6.27 2,106.72 5.70 1,915.20 7.60 2,553.60 11.00 3,696.00 9.73 3,269.28

L 48 14.40 691.20 5.97 286.56 6.27 300.96 5.70 273.60 7.60 364.80 11.00 528.00 9.73 467.04

XL 48 14.40 691.20 5.97 286.56 6.27 300.96 5.70 273.60 7.60 364.80 11.00 528.00 9.73 467.04

XXL 48 16.21 778.08 5.97 286.56 6.27 300.96 6.80 326.40 8.60 412.80 13.00 624.00 9.73 467.04

S 24 20.63 495.12 12.53 300.72 15.00 360.00 11.50 276.00 14.55 349.20 20.00 480.00

S 360 9.72 3,499.20 3.57 1,285.20 3.85 1,386.00 3.20 1,152.00 5.79 2,084.40 6.00 2,160.00 5.33 1,918.80

M 576 9.72 5,598.72 3.57 2,056.32 3.85 2,217.60 3.20 1,843.20 5.79 3,335.04 6.00 3,456.00 5.33 3,070.08

L 360 9.72 3,499.20 3.57 1,285.20 3.85 1,386.00 3.20 1,152.00 5.79 2,084.40 6.00 2,160.00 5.33 1,918.80

XL 288 9.72 2,799.36 3.57 1,028.16 3.85 1,108.80 3.20 921.60 5.79 1,667.52 6.00 1,728.00 5.33 1,535.04

XXL 36 12.15 437.40 5.11 183.96 5.55 199.80 4.20 151.20 8.00 288.00 8.00 288.00 5.33 191.88

XXXL 36 14.05 505.80 6.11 219.96 7.15 257.40 4.20 151.20 9.00 324.00 9.00 324.00 5.33 191.88

S 336 14.40 4,838.40 5.97 2,005.92 6.27 no 5.70 1,915.20 7.60 2,553.60 11.00 3,696.00 9.73 3,269.28

M 288 14.40 4,147.20 5.97 1,719.36 6.27 1,805.76 5.70 1,641.60 7.80 2,246.40 11.00 3,168.00 9.73 2,802.24

L 192 14.40 2,764.80 5.97 1,146.24 6.27 1,203.84 5.70 1,094.40 7.80 1,497.60 11.00 2,112.00 9.73 1,868.16

XL 192 14.40 2,764.80 5.97 1,146.24 6.27 1,203.84 5.70 1,094.40 7.60 1,459.20 11.00 2,112.00 9.73 1,868.16

XXL 24 16.21 389.04 5.97 143.28 6.27 150.48 6.80 163.20 8.60 206.40 13.00 312.00 9.73 233.52

XXXL 24 18.05 433.20 7.97 191.28 8.27 198.48 7.50 180.00 9.60 230.40 15.00 360.00 9.73 233.52

S 10 20.63 206.30 12.53 125.30 15.00 150.00 11.50 115.00 13.55 135.50 20.00 200.00

M 10 20.63 206.30 12.53 125.30 15.00 150.00 11.50 115.00 13.55 135.50 20.00 200.00

L 10 20.63 206.30 12.53 125.30 15.00 150.00 11.50 115.00 13.55 135.50 20.00 200.00

XL 10 20.63 206.30 12.53 125.30 15.00 150.00 11.50 115.00 13.55 135.50 20.00 200.00

XXL 5 23.34 116.70 14.11 70.55 18.00 90.00 13.00 65.00 15.67 78.35 22.00 110.00

XXXL 5 26.30 131.50 15.53 77.65 19.00 95.00 13.00 65.00 17.78 88.90 23.00 115.00

S 50 29.69 1,484.50 20.23 1,011.50 7.00 350.00 22.00 1,100.00 27.00 1,350.00

M 50 29.69 1,484.50 20.23 1,011.50 7.00 350.00 22.00 1,100.00 27.00 1,350.00

L 50 29.69 1,484.50 20.23 1,011.50 7.00 350.00 22.00 1,100.00 27.00 1,350.00
Sample 

Included 
Brand Sample 

Included 
Brand Sample 

Included 
Brand Sample 

Included 
Brand Sample 

Included 
Brand Sample 

Included 
Brand Sample 

Included 
Brand 

Y Sport-Tek N N/A N/A N/A N N/A Y Agusta Y Viehunt N/A N/A

TOTAL $58,625.70 $24,638.30 $21,395.48 $21,118.40 $33,952.37 $43,943.00 $32,113.20

30 days 15-25 days 30 days 15 days 30 days 20-25 days 21

30 days 5-7 days 15 days 15 days 10 days 4-6 days 21

yes yes yes plus shipping 
guarantee with min 

of 6 pieces 
yes yes

min of 12 per item 
to honor pricing 

Swanton, OH Russell Springs, KY 

Npact Inoprints

Farmers Branch, TX

Item #4 - Shirts

Item #1 - Shirts

Item #2 - Shorts 

Item #3 - Sweatpants 

WILLOWBROOK

ADDISON TRAIL

Bid Results - PE Uniform Bid Opening Friday April 19, 2024; 11:30 am

Item #5- Shorts

BSNGame On

No Bid

Lead Time for Delivery

Item #7-Yoga Pants

Item #6- Sweatpants

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Chicago, IL 

No Bid

Re-order time

Ambassdor Athletic 
Apparel

Arlington Heights, IL 

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Pricing held for full year

Jonah's Enterprises

Robbinsville, NJ

Adwear Specialty 

Houston, TX

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid
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