
ITEM

#
PACK

1 Bathroom Tissue no bid no bid 27.60         29.75         27.75         

Brand: National                   NO SUBSTITUTE 96/case 452 cases

ID# 832

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength no bid no bid no bid 7.45           7.65           

Brand: six 1 gal. 75 case

ID# /case

3 Can Liners, Polyethylene .70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 

55 gallon capacity 
22.80* 11.90         no bid no bid no bid

Brand: 100/case   545 cases *Items 3, 4 & 5

ID# must be purchased

together.

4 Can Liners, Polyethylene .9 mil 30 x 36, 

20-30 gallon capacity
17.70* 14.05         1,264.50    no bid no bid no bid

Brand: 250/case 90 cases *Items 3, 4 & 5 Central Poly 

ID# must be purchased #CP3036.9

together.

5 Can Liners, Polyethylene .35 mil 22.5 x 24.5 

7-10 gallon capacity
17.20* 11.10         no bid no bid no bid

Brand: 500/case 20 cases *Items 3, 4 & 5

ID# must be purchased

together.

6 Disinfectant wipes        70/container or better 28.65         no bid no bid no bid 26.11         Clorox

Brand: 12 per case 170 cases 70/tub/12/cs 70/tub/12/cs

ID# 840 per cs 840 per cs

0.0341       each 0.0311       each

7 Dust Mop Heads w/snaps no bid no bid no bid no bid 63.58         

Brand: 24" 4 dozen

ID# 

8 Floor Cleaner, Grease & Oil Cleaner 49.15         no bid no bid no bid 43.71         

Brand: Diversey: Profi NO SUBSTITUTE 4 gal/case 40 cases

ID# 4512759

9 Floor Finish 57.10         no bid no bid no bid 53.46         

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra NO SUBSTITUTE 5 gallon 775 gallons /5 gallon jug /5 gallon jug

ID# containers 11.42         per gal 10.69         per gal

10 Floor Sealer 81.70         no bid no bid no bid 75.28         

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Plaza NO SUBSTITUTE 5 gallon 15 gallons /5 gallon jug /5 gallon jug

ID# containers 16.34         per gal 15.06         per gal

11 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep MAROON - 14"X20" 116.85       no bid 108.80       no bid 110.11       

Brand: 3M or equal 10/case 20 cases

ID# 51111 025901

12 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep MAROON - 20" 87.95         no bid 80.00         no bid 81.42         

Brand: 3M or equal 10/case 30 cases

ID#

13 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: LARGE no bid no bid no bid 20.95         419.00        no bid

Brand: PRO LINK VINYL NO SUBSTITUTE 100 gloves/box 20 cases 100 g/bx;10 bx/cs

ID# 10 boxes/case 1,000.00    per cs

0.0210       

14 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: EX-LARGE no bid no bid no bid 20.95         419.00        no bid

Brand: PRO LINK VINYL NO SUBSTITUTE 100 gloves/box 20 cases

ID# 10 boxes/case

15 J-Fill Bath & Bowl 55.50         no bid no bid no bid 48.66         389.28       

Brand: Diversey CREW NO SUBSTITUTE 2 - 84.5 oz 8 cases

ID#3172650 containers

/case

16 J-Fill Neutral Cleaner 129.00       no bid no bid no bid 119.60       

Brand: Diversey STRIDE NO SUBSTITUTE 2 - 84.5 oz 16 cases

ID# containers

/case

17 J-Fill Dispenser for 2 products no charge no bid no bid no bid no charge

Brand: Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE each 4 each if purchased if purchased

ID# w/cleaner w/cleaner

18 KAIBLOOEY restroom cleaner 51.75         1,035.00    no bid no bid no bid no bid

Brand: Kaiblooey NO SUBSTITUTE 4 gallons 20 cases

ID# /case

19 Pencil Sharpeners no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Brand: Giant NO SUBSTITUTE each 24 each

ID# M3-AP806

20 Polish, Furniture & Wood Wipes 10x12 no bid no bid 16.90         211.25       no bid 28.84         

Brand: Claire OR EQUAL 25/tub, 12.5 case 30/tub;4 t/cs 25/tub;6 t/cs

ID# C-974 6 tubs/cs 120            per cs 150            per cs

150 wipes/cs

1,500 total

0.1408       each 0.1923       each

21 Roll Towels no bid no bid 16.80         14.97         5,988.00     16.58         

Brand: Bay West NO SUBSTITUTE Six 8" rolls 400 cases

ID# 208 /case

22 Roll Towel 8" Dispenser - White no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Brand: Palmer NO SUBSTITUTE each 5 each

ID# 56701
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I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/24/2015 @ 1:30 PM

NOTE: Bid specs called for 10 cs @ 150/cs: 1,500 
wipes. 



ITEM

#
PACK

1 Bathroom Tissue

Brand: National                   NO SUBSTITUTE 96/case 452 cases

ID# 832

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength

Brand: six 1 gal. 75 case

ID# /case

3 Can Liners, Polyethylene .70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 

55 gallon capacity 
Brand: 100/case   545 cases

ID#

4 Can Liners, Polyethylene .9 mil 30 x 36, 

20-30 gallon capacity
Brand: 250/case 90 cases

ID#

5 Can Liners, Polyethylene .35 mil 22.5 x 24.5 

7-10 gallon capacity
Brand: 500/case 20 cases

ID#

6 Disinfectant wipes        70/container or better

Brand: 12 per case 170 cases

ID#

7 Dust Mop Heads w/snaps 

Brand: 24" 4 dozen

ID# 

8 Floor Cleaner, Grease & Oil Cleaner

Brand: Diversey: Profi NO SUBSTITUTE 4 gal/case 40 cases

ID# 4512759

9 Floor Finish 

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra NO SUBSTITUTE 5 gallon 775 gallons

ID# containers

10 Floor Sealer 

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Plaza NO SUBSTITUTE 5 gallon 15 gallons

ID# containers

11 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep MAROON - 14"X20"

Brand: 3M or equal 10/case 20 cases

ID# 51111 025901

12 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep MAROON - 20"

Brand: 3M or equal 10/case 30 cases

ID#

13 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: LARGE

Brand: PRO LINK VINYL NO SUBSTITUTE 100 gloves/box 20 cases

ID# 10 boxes/case

14 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: EX-LARGE

Brand: PRO LINK VINYL NO SUBSTITUTE 100 gloves/box 20 cases

ID# 10 boxes/case

15 J-Fill Bath & Bowl

Brand: Diversey CREW NO SUBSTITUTE 2 - 84.5 oz 8 cases

ID#3172650 containers

/case

16 J-Fill Neutral Cleaner

Brand: Diversey STRIDE NO SUBSTITUTE 2 - 84.5 oz 16 cases

ID# containers

/case

17 J-Fill Dispenser for 2 products

Brand: Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE each 4 each

ID#

18 KAIBLOOEY restroom cleaner

Brand: Kaiblooey NO SUBSTITUTE 4 gallons 20 cases

ID# /case

19 Pencil Sharpeners 

Brand: Giant NO SUBSTITUTE each 24 each

ID# M3-AP806

20 Polish, Furniture & Wood Wipes 10x12

Brand: Claire OR EQUAL 25/tub, 12.5 case

ID# C-974 6 tubs/cs

150 wipes/cs

1,500 total

21 Roll Towels 

Brand: Bay West NO SUBSTITUTE Six 8" rolls 400 cases

ID# 208 /case

22 Roll Towel 8" Dispenser - White

Brand: Palmer NO SUBSTITUTE each 5 each

ID# 56701

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/24/2015 @ 1:30 PM

NOTE: Bid specs called for 10 cs @ 150/cs: 1,500 
wipes. 

26.24         11,860.48      no bid 27.50         no bid 26.89         

8.77           no bid 6.05           no bid 5.73           429.75       

9.45           no bid 10.41         8.24           4,490.80      9.79           

UPL 4348HV

15.49         no bid 15.84         no bid 14.90         

7.97           159.40           no bid 8.10           no bid 15.49         

39.98         27.98         36.23         Clorox no bid 23.00         3,910.00    

180/tub;6/cs 75/tub;6/cs 70/tub/12/cs 70/tub/12/cs

1,080 per cs 450 per cs 840 per cs 840 per cs

0.0370       each 0.0622       each 0.0431       each 0.0274       each

38.29         153.16           40.92         no bid no bid no bid

60.80         no bid no bid no bid 43.68         1,747.20    

75.80         no bid no bid no bid 9.57           7,416.75    

/5 gallon jug /per gallon

15.16         per gal

92.20         no bid 15.10         no bid 14.75         221.25       

/5 gallon jug /per gallon

18.44         per gal

no bid 19.10         382.00       106.15       no bid no bid

confirmed this is

price for carton of 10

no bid 21.98         659.40       73.69         no bid no bid

confirmed this is

price for carton of 10

no bid 25.50         22.00         no bid no bid

no bid 25.50         22.00         no bid no bid

52.90         no bid no bid no bid no bid

52.95         847.20           no bid no bid no bid no bid

36.00         144.00           no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid 59.02         no bid no bid

no bid 6.98           167.52       18.00         no bid no bid

23.69         69.95         17.00         no bid no bid

25/tub;6 t/cs 24/pk;12pks/cs 30/tub;4 t/cs

150            288            per cs 120.00       per case

0.1579       each 0.2429       each 0.1417       each

15.34         no bid 15.35         no bid 15.31         

ALT:

13.99         not as spec'd

6 - 800'rolls/cs

no bid no bid 54.00         270.00         no bid no bid
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ITEM

#
PACK

1 Bathroom Tissue

Brand: National                   NO SUBSTITUTE 96/case 452 cases

ID# 832

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength

Brand: six 1 gal. 75 case

ID# /case

3 Can Liners, Polyethylene .70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 

55 gallon capacity 
Brand: 100/case   545 cases

ID#

4 Can Liners, Polyethylene .9 mil 30 x 36, 

20-30 gallon capacity
Brand: 250/case 90 cases

ID#

5 Can Liners, Polyethylene .35 mil 22.5 x 24.5 

7-10 gallon capacity
Brand: 500/case 20 cases

ID#

6 Disinfectant wipes        70/container or better

Brand: 12 per case 170 cases

ID#

7 Dust Mop Heads w/snaps 

Brand: 24" 4 dozen

ID# 

8 Floor Cleaner, Grease & Oil Cleaner

Brand: Diversey: Profi NO SUBSTITUTE 4 gal/case 40 cases

ID# 4512759

9 Floor Finish 

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra NO SUBSTITUTE 5 gallon 775 gallons

ID# containers

10 Floor Sealer 

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Plaza NO SUBSTITUTE 5 gallon 15 gallons

ID# containers

11 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep MAROON - 14"X20"

Brand: 3M or equal 10/case 20 cases

ID# 51111 025901

12 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep MAROON - 20"

Brand: 3M or equal 10/case 30 cases

ID#

13 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: LARGE

Brand: PRO LINK VINYL NO SUBSTITUTE 100 gloves/box 20 cases

ID# 10 boxes/case

14 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: EX-LARGE

Brand: PRO LINK VINYL NO SUBSTITUTE 100 gloves/box 20 cases

ID# 10 boxes/case

15 J-Fill Bath & Bowl

Brand: Diversey CREW NO SUBSTITUTE 2 - 84.5 oz 8 cases

ID#3172650 containers

/case

16 J-Fill Neutral Cleaner

Brand: Diversey STRIDE NO SUBSTITUTE 2 - 84.5 oz 16 cases

ID# containers

/case

17 J-Fill Dispenser for 2 products

Brand: Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE each 4 each

ID#

18 KAIBLOOEY restroom cleaner

Brand: Kaiblooey NO SUBSTITUTE 4 gallons 20 cases

ID# /case

19 Pencil Sharpeners 

Brand: Giant NO SUBSTITUTE each 24 each

ID# M3-AP806

20 Polish, Furniture & Wood Wipes 10x12

Brand: Claire OR EQUAL 25/tub, 12.5 case

ID# C-974 6 tubs/cs

150 wipes/cs

1,500 total

21 Roll Towels 

Brand: Bay West NO SUBSTITUTE Six 8" rolls 400 cases

ID# 208 /case

22 Roll Towel 8" Dispenser - White

Brand: Palmer NO SUBSTITUTE each 5 each

ID# 56701

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/24/2015 @ 1:30 PM

NOTE: Bid specs called for 10 cs @ 150/cs: 1,500 
wipes. 

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 7.59

14.84         8.84           9.43           11.40         A 10.98
11.22

B* 9.48 *not as

C* 8.24 spec'd

D* 7.18

16.67         11.84         16.68         17.70         A 15.98 20.01         

B* 12.72 *not as

C* 9.98 spec'd

D* 8.48

18.50         8.34           13.40         20.86         A 10.48
16.38

1,000         per cs B* 7.74 *not as

0.02086     ea C* 7.74 spec'd

D* 7.74

no bid no bid no bid 33.55         no bid 80.08

155/tub;6 t/cs 70/tub/12/cs

930            per cs 840 per cs

0.0361       each 0.0953       each

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 43.09

ties, not snaps

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid 114.40       no bid 112.48

no bid no bid no bid 82.77         no bid 43.24

no bid no bid no bid 21.40         no bid no bid

ProLink is not a mfg

0.0214       

no bid no bid no bid 21.40         no bid no bid

100 g/bx;10 bx/cs:1000/cs

0.0214       

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 52.50         

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Page 1-C
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ITEM

#
PACK

1 Bathroom Tissue

Brand: National                   NO SUBSTITUTE 96/case 452 cases

ID# 832

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength

Brand: six 1 gal. 75 case

ID# /case

3 Can Liners, Polyethylene .70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 

55 gallon capacity 
Brand: 100/case   545 cases

ID#

4 Can Liners, Polyethylene .9 mil 30 x 36, 

20-30 gallon capacity
Brand: 250/case 90 cases

ID#

5 Can Liners, Polyethylene .35 mil 22.5 x 24.5 

7-10 gallon capacity
Brand: 500/case 20 cases

ID#

6 Disinfectant wipes        70/container or better

Brand: 12 per case 170 cases

ID#

7 Dust Mop Heads w/snaps 

Brand: 24" 4 dozen

ID# 

8 Floor Cleaner, Grease & Oil Cleaner

Brand: Diversey: Profi NO SUBSTITUTE 4 gal/case 40 cases

ID# 4512759

9 Floor Finish 

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra NO SUBSTITUTE 5 gallon 775 gallons

ID# containers

10 Floor Sealer 

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Plaza NO SUBSTITUTE 5 gallon 15 gallons

ID# containers

11 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep MAROON - 14"X20"

Brand: 3M or equal 10/case 20 cases

ID# 51111 025901

12 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep MAROON - 20"

Brand: 3M or equal 10/case 30 cases

ID#

13 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: LARGE

Brand: PRO LINK VINYL NO SUBSTITUTE 100 gloves/box 20 cases

ID# 10 boxes/case

14 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: EX-LARGE

Brand: PRO LINK VINYL NO SUBSTITUTE 100 gloves/box 20 cases

ID# 10 boxes/case

15 J-Fill Bath & Bowl

Brand: Diversey CREW NO SUBSTITUTE 2 - 84.5 oz 8 cases

ID#3172650 containers

/case

16 J-Fill Neutral Cleaner

Brand: Diversey STRIDE NO SUBSTITUTE 2 - 84.5 oz 16 cases

ID# containers

/case

17 J-Fill Dispenser for 2 products

Brand: Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE each 4 each

ID#

18 KAIBLOOEY restroom cleaner

Brand: Kaiblooey NO SUBSTITUTE 4 gallons 20 cases

ID# /case

19 Pencil Sharpeners 

Brand: Giant NO SUBSTITUTE each 24 each

ID# M3-AP806

20 Polish, Furniture & Wood Wipes 10x12

Brand: Claire OR EQUAL 25/tub, 12.5 case

ID# C-974 6 tubs/cs

150 wipes/cs

1,500 total

21 Roll Towels 

Brand: Bay West NO SUBSTITUTE Six 8" rolls 400 cases

ID# 208 /case

22 Roll Towel 8" Dispenser - White

Brand: Palmer NO SUBSTITUTE each 5 each

ID# 56701

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/24/2015 @ 1:30 PM

NOTE: Bid specs called for 10 cs @ 150/cs: 1,500 
wipes. 

32.21         

9.65           

11.96         

17.56         

9.28           

21.45         

6/cs

340 ech/cs

0.0631 each

57.59         

79.15         

88.49         

/5 gal jug 

17.70         per gal

108.19       

/5 gallon jug?

21.64         per gal

124.70       

124.70       

no bid

no bid

76.53         

no bid

no bid

54.99         

no bid

no bid

44.79         

no bid
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ITEM

#
PACK Linden, NJ Alsip, IL

AmSan
Central Poly 

Corp.

Indianapolis, IN Glenview, IL Hazel Crest, IL

Cicero Mfg 

& Supply

Expert 

Chemical
HP Products

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/24/2015 @ 1:30 PM

23 12.50         150.00       no bid no bid no bid 12.83         

Brand: Kotex Sanibags OR EQUAL 500/case 12 cases

ID#

24 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming no bid no bid no bid 23.00         5,060.00     no bid

Brand: InoDerm NO SUBSTITUTE 1,000 ml/bag 220 cases

ID# 5080-FL1000 6 bags/case

25 Sponges, Scrubbing no bid no bid 34.64         no bid 35.47         

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite NO SUBSTITUTE 30/case 20 cases

ID# 74

26 Sponges, MAGIC ERASER NO SUBSTITUTE 27.90         no bid no bid no bid 22.26         445.20       

Brand: Proctor & Gamble MR. CLEAN 4 pads/box 20 cases

ID# PGc82028 6 boxes/case

27 Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes no bid no bid 16.90         507.00       no bid 45.26         

Brand: 40/tub 30 cases 30/tub;4 t/cs 40/tub;6 t/cs

ID# 6 tubs/case 120            per cs 240            per cs

(240/case) 0.1408       each 0.1886       each

28 Tissue, facial, 2 ply 24.40         no bid 16.80         12.30         15.63         

Brand: 100/box 240 cases

ID# 30 boxes/cs

29 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para 9.80           no bid no bid 11.70         15.13         

Brand: 12/case 70 cases

ID#

30 Vacuum no bid no bid 199.00       1,194.00    no bid no bid

Brand: Panasonic NO SUBSTITUTE each 6 each

ID# MC-GG283

31 Waste Cans/Classroom Large, Metal, GREY, 15-18 gallon no bid no bid no bid no bid 40.14         

Brand: each 20 each

ID#

32 White Board Cleaner 1 gallon container no bid no bid no bid no bid 78.95         

Brand: 4 gal/case 15 case

ID# 

33 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot-for waxing100% Rayon 24 oz. no bid no bid no bid no bid 4.76           

Brand: each 24 each

ID#

AmSan Central Poly 
Corp. Cicero Mfg 
& Supply Expert 
Chemical HP Products

GRAND TOTAL BID: 55,585.54$                   Total: 1,185.00$    Total: 1,264.50$    Total: 1,912.25$    Total: 11,886.00$   Total: 834.48$       
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Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags - 4 x 2 x 9 Wax

NOTE: Bid specs called for 15 cs @ 240/cs:3,600 wipes. 
Cicero's price @ 120/cs = 1,800 wipes. Ordering 30 cases @ 
120/cs. Cicero's price/ea is best.



ITEM

#
PACKI T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/24/2015 @ 1:30 PM

23

Brand: Kotex Sanibags OR EQUAL 500/case 12 cases

ID#

24 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming

Brand: InoDerm NO SUBSTITUTE 1,000 ml/bag 220 cases

ID# 5080-FL1000 6 bags/case

25 Sponges, Scrubbing

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite NO SUBSTITUTE 30/case 20 cases

ID# 74

26 Sponges, MAGIC ERASER NO SUBSTITUTE

Brand: Proctor & Gamble MR. CLEAN 4 pads/box 20 cases

ID# PGc82028 6 boxes/case

27 Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes

Brand: 40/tub 30 cases

ID# 6 tubs/case

(240/case)

28 Tissue, facial, 2 ply

Brand: 100/box 240 cases

ID# 30 boxes/cs

29 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para

Brand: 12/case 70 cases

ID#

30 Vacuum

Brand: Panasonic NO SUBSTITUTE each 6 each

ID# MC-GG283

31 Waste Cans/Classroom Large, Metal, GREY, 15-18 gallon

Brand: each 20 each

ID#

32 White Board Cleaner 1 gallon container

Brand: 4 gal/case 15 case

ID# 

33 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot-for waxing100% Rayon 24 oz. 

Brand: each 24 each

ID#

GRAND TOTAL BID: 55,585.54$                   

Page 2-A

Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags - 4 x 2 x 9 Wax

NOTE: Bid specs called for 15 cs @ 240/cs:3,600 wipes. 
Cicero's price @ 120/cs = 1,800 wipes. Ordering 30 cases @ 
120/cs. Cicero's price/ea is best.

Wood Dale, IL Brooklyn, NY

Pyramid Ramrod Unipak Valdes LLCPro Source

Rockford, IL Tampa, FL Northbrook, IL

17.75         13.98         12.70         no bid no bid

24.68         no bid 25.25         no bid no bid

ALT: not as spec'd

37.10         no bid 28.00         560.00         no bid no bid

no bid 27.99         23.75         no bid no bid

50.29         47.49         17.00         no bid no bid

40/tub/6t/cs 30/tub;6tub/cs 30/tub;4 t/cs

240            per cs 180 per cs 120            per cs

0.2095       each 0.2638       0.1417       each

12.65         12.99         15.90         no bid 12.25         2,940.00    

11.49         9.18           642.60       9.25           no bid no bid

no bid no bid 220.00       no bid no bid

no bid 19.89         397.80       24.55         no bid no bid

no bid 87.96         66.00         990.00         no bid no bid

4.84           5.99           4.75           114.00         no bid no bid

Pro Source Pyramid Ramrod Unipak Valdes LLC

Total: 13,164.24$      Total: 2,249.32$    Total: 1,934.00$      Total: 4,490.80$      Total: 16,664.95$  
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ITEM

#
PACKI T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/24/2015 @ 1:30 PM

23

Brand: Kotex Sanibags OR EQUAL 500/case 12 cases

ID#

24 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming

Brand: InoDerm NO SUBSTITUTE 1,000 ml/bag 220 cases

ID# 5080-FL1000 6 bags/case

25 Sponges, Scrubbing

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite NO SUBSTITUTE 30/case 20 cases

ID# 74

26 Sponges, MAGIC ERASER NO SUBSTITUTE

Brand: Proctor & Gamble MR. CLEAN 4 pads/box 20 cases

ID# PGc82028 6 boxes/case

27 Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes

Brand: 40/tub 30 cases

ID# 6 tubs/case

(240/case)

28 Tissue, facial, 2 ply

Brand: 100/box 240 cases

ID# 30 boxes/cs

29 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para

Brand: 12/case 70 cases

ID#

30 Vacuum

Brand: Panasonic NO SUBSTITUTE each 6 each

ID# MC-GG283

31 Waste Cans/Classroom Large, Metal, GREY, 15-18 gallon

Brand: each 20 each

ID#

32 White Board Cleaner 1 gallon container

Brand: 4 gal/case 15 case

ID# 

33 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot-for waxing100% Rayon 24 oz. 

Brand: each 24 each

ID#

GRAND TOTAL BID: 55,585.54$                   

Page 2-A

Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags - 4 x 2 x 9 Wax

NOTE: Bid specs called for 15 cs @ 240/cs:3,600 wipes. 
Cicero's price @ 120/cs = 1,800 wipes. Ordering 30 cases @ 
120/cs. Cicero's price/ea is best.

Calico 

Industries

Lawrenceburg, TN

Dynapak Corp.
All American 

Poly

Montgomery, NJ
Annapolis Junction, 

MD
St. Louis, MOPiscataway, NY

Industrial 

Soap

Interboro 

Packaging

Performance 

Chemical

Tinley Park, IL

no bid no bid no bid 27.20         no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid 26.02         no bid 23.46

no bid no bid no bid 44.05         no bid 47.40

40/tub/6t/cs 40/tub/6t/cs

240/cs 240            per cs

0.1835       each 0.1975       each

no bid no bid no bid 12.44         no bid 16.74

no bid no bid no bid 10.09         no bid 13.42

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 6.82

All American 
Poly Calico 
Industries Dynapak Corp. Industrial 
Soap Interboro Packaging Performance Chem

Total: -$             Total: -$             Total: -$             Total: -$             Total: Total: -$             
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ITEM

#
PACKI T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/24/2015 @ 1:30 PM

23

Brand: Kotex Sanibags OR EQUAL 500/case 12 cases

ID#

24 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming

Brand: InoDerm NO SUBSTITUTE 1,000 ml/bag 220 cases

ID# 5080-FL1000 6 bags/case

25 Sponges, Scrubbing

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite NO SUBSTITUTE 30/case 20 cases

ID# 74

26 Sponges, MAGIC ERASER NO SUBSTITUTE

Brand: Proctor & Gamble MR. CLEAN 4 pads/box 20 cases

ID# PGc82028 6 boxes/case

27 Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes

Brand: 40/tub 30 cases

ID# 6 tubs/case

(240/case)

28 Tissue, facial, 2 ply

Brand: 100/box 240 cases

ID# 30 boxes/cs

29 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para

Brand: 12/case 70 cases

ID#

30 Vacuum

Brand: Panasonic NO SUBSTITUTE each 6 each

ID# MC-GG283

31 Waste Cans/Classroom Large, Metal, GREY, 15-18 gallon

Brand: each 20 each

ID#

32 White Board Cleaner 1 gallon container

Brand: 4 gal/case 15 case

ID# 

33 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot-for waxing100% Rayon 24 oz. 

Brand: each 24 each

ID#

GRAND TOTAL BID: 55,585.54$                   
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Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags - 4 x 2 x 9 Wax

NOTE: Bid specs called for 15 cs @ 240/cs:3,600 wipes. 
Cicero's price @ 120/cs = 1,800 wipes. Ordering 30 cases @ 
120/cs. Cicero's price/ea is best.

The Standard 

Co.

Hamilton, NJ

61.49         

no bid

38.21         

25.43         

54.20         

30/tub/12 t/cs

360            per cs

0.1506       each

18.89         

15.16         

no bid

no bid

98.25         

5.29           

 

The Standard 
Co.

Total: -$             
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