
Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m. All American Poly Calico Packaging
Central Poly Bag 

Corporation
Chemcraft Industries

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

1 Bathroom Tissue 96/case 470 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 27.55 $12,948.50

Brand: NPS Corp or Equal

ID# 12325 (sample must be included with bid)

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength 6-1 gallon/case 55 case
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 14.54 $799.70

3 Can Liners, Polyethylene:   .70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 55 gallon  capacity 100/case   545 cases
per 
case

14.98      $8,164.10 8.14      $4,436.30 11.20     $6,104.00 9.13 $4,975.85

4 Can Liners, Polyethylene:  .9 mil 30 x 36; 20-30 gallon capacity 250/case 120 cases
per 
case

19.60      $2,352.00 11.34    $1,360.80 14.10     $1,692.00 no bid

5 Can Liners, Polyethylene:  .35 mil 22.5 x 24.5; 7-10 gallon capacity 500/case 45 cases
per 
case

23.30      $1,048.50 7.74      $348.30 10.40     $468.00 7.59 $341.55

6 Disinfectant Bathroom Cleaner: Non-Acid Bowl & Bath 3 x 1 gallon 35 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 51.00 $1,785.00

Brand: P&G Comet Disinfectant /case

ID# 20542 (no substitute)

7 Disinfectant cleaner Kaibosh 4 gallons 10 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 53.30 $533.00

Brand: KAIVAC - ID# KBOSH (no substitute) /case

8 Disinfectant Spray 12 oz can 27 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid $701.36

12 oz can 17 oz

12/case 36.80/cs 12/cs

=144 oz/cs 204 oz/case

27 cases = 3,888 oz total needed .1804 per oz 

9
Disinfectant Wipes: 70/container @ 12 per case (840 total wipes) * 
33 cases = 27,720 wipes

33 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid $1,248.02

12/cs

75 container

.04502 ea

10 Floor Conditioner & Neutralizer 1 oz packs 10 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 29.70 $297.00

Brand: Stearns - ID# ST729 (no substitute) 72/case

11 Floor Finish 5 gallon 775 gallons
per 

gallon
no bid no bid no bid no bid

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra (no substitute) box

12 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep - MAROON - 14"x20" 10/case 15 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 106.88 $1,603.20

Brand: 3M (no substitute) - ID# 51111 025901

13 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep - MAROON - 20" 10/case 20 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 77.25 $1,545.00

Brand: 3M (no substitute)  



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m.

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

1 Bathroom Tissue 96/case 470 cases
per 
case

Brand: NPS Corp or Equal

ID# 12325 (sample must be included with bid)

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength 6-1 gallon/case 55 case
per 
case

3 Can Liners, Polyethylene:   .70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 55 gallon  capacity 100/case   545 cases
per 
case

4 Can Liners, Polyethylene:  .9 mil 30 x 36; 20-30 gallon capacity 250/case 120 cases
per 
case

5 Can Liners, Polyethylene:  .35 mil 22.5 x 24.5; 7-10 gallon capacity 500/case 45 cases
per 
case

6 Disinfectant Bathroom Cleaner: Non-Acid Bowl & Bath 3 x 1 gallon 35 cases
per 
case

Brand: P&G Comet Disinfectant /case

ID# 20542 (no substitute)

7 Disinfectant cleaner Kaibosh 4 gallons 10 cases
per 
case

Brand: KAIVAC - ID# KBOSH (no substitute) /case

8 Disinfectant Spray 12 oz can 27 cases
per 
case

12 oz can

12/case

=144 oz/cs

27 cases = 3,888 oz total needed

9
Disinfectant Wipes: 70/container @ 12 per case (840 total wipes) * 
33 cases = 27,720 wipes

33 cases
per 
case

10 Floor Conditioner & Neutralizer 1 oz packs 10 cases
per 
case

Brand: Stearns - ID# ST729 (no substitute) 72/case

11 Floor Finish 5 gallon 775 gallons
per 

gallon
Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra (no substitute) box

12 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep - MAROON - 14"x20" 10/case 15 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute) - ID# 51111 025901

13 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep - MAROON - 20" 10/case 20 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)  

Cicero Mfg. & Supply Company Dash Medical Gloves Expert Chemical Supply Ferguson Facilities Supply

32.83 $15,430.10 no bid 29.00      $13,630.00 28.07 $13,192.90

14.78 $812.90 no bid 8.50        $467.50 9.65 $530.75

17.94 $9,777.30 no bid no bid no bid

23.50 $2,820.00 no bid no bid no bid

13.38 $602.10 no bid no bid no bid

61.00 $2,135.00 no bid no bid no bid

62.80 $628.00 no bid no bid 106.68 $1,066.80

50.41 $1,361.07 no bid 22.84      $616.68 $473.04

12 oz can 20 oz

12/case 29.20/cs 12/cs

240 oz/case

.1217 per oz

$1,838.43 no bid no bid $1,789.88

12/cs 6/cs

70 container 75 container

.06632 ea .06457 ea

45.95 $459.50 no bid no bid 39.95 $399.50

16.71 $12,950.25 no bid no bid 12.39 $9,602.25

129.76 $1,946.40 no bid no bid 116.62 $1,749.30

91.29 $1,825.80 no bid no bid 81.95 $1,639.00



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m.

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

1 Bathroom Tissue 96/case 470 cases
per 
case

Brand: NPS Corp or Equal

ID# 12325 (sample must be included with bid)

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength 6-1 gallon/case 55 case
per 
case

3 Can Liners, Polyethylene:   .70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 55 gallon  capacity 100/case   545 cases
per 
case

4 Can Liners, Polyethylene:  .9 mil 30 x 36; 20-30 gallon capacity 250/case 120 cases
per 
case

5 Can Liners, Polyethylene:  .35 mil 22.5 x 24.5; 7-10 gallon capacity 500/case 45 cases
per 
case

6 Disinfectant Bathroom Cleaner: Non-Acid Bowl & Bath 3 x 1 gallon 35 cases
per 
case

Brand: P&G Comet Disinfectant /case

ID# 20542 (no substitute)

7 Disinfectant cleaner Kaibosh 4 gallons 10 cases
per 
case

Brand: KAIVAC - ID# KBOSH (no substitute) /case

8 Disinfectant Spray 12 oz can 27 cases
per 
case

12 oz can

12/case

=144 oz/cs

27 cases = 3,888 oz total needed

9
Disinfectant Wipes: 70/container @ 12 per case (840 total wipes) * 
33 cases = 27,720 wipes

33 cases
per 
case

10 Floor Conditioner & Neutralizer 1 oz packs 10 cases
per 
case

Brand: Stearns - ID# ST729 (no substitute) 72/case

11 Floor Finish 5 gallon 775 gallons
per 

gallon
Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra (no substitute) box

12 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep - MAROON - 14"x20" 10/case 15 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute) - ID# 51111 025901

13 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep - MAROON - 20" 10/case 20 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)  

Interborough Packaging LaPorte, Inc. North American Pro Source Pyramid School Products

no bid 27.81     $13,070.70 30.15 $14,170.50 23.49 $11,040.30 no bid

no bid no bid 15.91      $875.05 7.88 $433.40 no bid

9.84a $5,362.80 11.91     $6,490.95 no bid 9.05 $4,932.25 no bid

8.48b $4,621.60

7.48c $4,076.60

6.98d $3,804.10

16.48a $1,977.60 17.91     $2,149.20 no bid 11.29 $1,354.80 no bid

15.24b $1,828.80

11.14c $1,336.80

9.32d $1,118.40

10.82a $486.90 no bid no bid 7.79 $350.55 no bid

7.68b $345.60

7.68c $345.60

7.68d $345.60

no bid no bid 52.99      $1,854.65 no bid no bid

no bid no bid 59.25      $592.50 no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid $520.21 $420.88

16 oz 20 oz can

25.69/cs 12/cs 25.98/cs 12/cs

192 oz/case 240 oz/case

.1338 per oz .10825 per oz

no bid no bid $4,236.54 $1,230.77 $1,723.35

6/cs 12/cs 6/cs

50 container 75 container 75 container

.1528 ea .0444 ea .06217 ea

no bid no bid no bid 25.90 $259.00 no bid

no bid 13.13     $10,175.75 no bid 62.63 $48,538.25 no bid

no bid no bid no bid 137.00 $2,055.00 141.95 $2,129.25

no bid no bid no bid 96.75 $1,935.00 89.98 $1,799.60



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m.

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

1 Bathroom Tissue 96/case 470 cases
per 
case

Brand: NPS Corp or Equal

ID# 12325 (sample must be included with bid)

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength 6-1 gallon/case 55 case
per 
case

3 Can Liners, Polyethylene:   .70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 55 gallon  capacity 100/case   545 cases
per 
case

4 Can Liners, Polyethylene:  .9 mil 30 x 36; 20-30 gallon capacity 250/case 120 cases
per 
case

5 Can Liners, Polyethylene:  .35 mil 22.5 x 24.5; 7-10 gallon capacity 500/case 45 cases
per 
case

6 Disinfectant Bathroom Cleaner: Non-Acid Bowl & Bath 3 x 1 gallon 35 cases
per 
case

Brand: P&G Comet Disinfectant /case

ID# 20542 (no substitute)

7 Disinfectant cleaner Kaibosh 4 gallons 10 cases
per 
case

Brand: KAIVAC - ID# KBOSH (no substitute) /case

8 Disinfectant Spray 12 oz can 27 cases
per 
case

12 oz can

12/case

=144 oz/cs

27 cases = 3,888 oz total needed

9
Disinfectant Wipes: 70/container @ 12 per case (840 total wipes) * 
33 cases = 27,720 wipes

33 cases
per 
case

10 Floor Conditioner & Neutralizer 1 oz packs 10 cases
per 
case

Brand: Stearns - ID# ST729 (no substitute) 72/case

11 Floor Finish 5 gallon 775 gallons
per 

gallon
Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra (no substitute) box

12 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep - MAROON - 14"x20" 10/case 15 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute) - ID# 51111 025901

13 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep - MAROON - 20" 10/case 20 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)  

Ramrod Distributors, Inc.
The Standard 

Companies
Unipak Valdes LLC Warehouse Direct

27.75 $13,042.50 31.80 $14,946.00 no bid 25.33     $11,905.10 29.39 $13,813.30

7.00 $385.00 8.75 $481.25 no bid 11.75     $646.25 5.25 $288.75

21.75 $11,853.75 11.71 $6,381.95 7.18     $3,913.10 no bid 9.88 $5,384.60

12.75 $1,530.00 19.00 $2,280.00 11.18   $1,341.60 no bid 15.20 $1,824.00

8.45 $380.25 8.75 $393.75 no bid no bid 7.49 $337.05

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

22.90 $618.30 $698.27 no bid no bid 39.27 $1,060.29

12 oz can 16.5 oz 12 oz can

12/case 35.56/cs 12/cs 12/case
198 oz/case

.1796 per oz

$500.35 $1,262.80 no bid no bid $687.46

12/cs 12/cs 6/cs

240 container 75 container 200 container

0.01805 ea .04555 ea .0248 ea

29.70 $297.00 no bid no bid no bid 29.25 $292.50

10.98 $8,509.50 14.29 $11,074.75 no bid no bid 11.85 $9,183.75

107.10 $1,606.50 124.24 $1,863.60 no bid no bid 129.10 $1,936.50

77.17 $1,543.40 87.29 $1,745.80 no bid no bid 93.70 $1,874.00



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m.

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

1 Bathroom Tissue 96/case 470 cases
per 
case

Brand: NPS Corp or Equal

ID# 12325 (sample must be included with bid)

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength 6-1 gallon/case 55 case
per 
case

3 Can Liners, Polyethylene:   .70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 55 gallon  capacity 100/case   545 cases
per 
case

4 Can Liners, Polyethylene:  .9 mil 30 x 36; 20-30 gallon capacity 250/case 120 cases
per 
case

5 Can Liners, Polyethylene:  .35 mil 22.5 x 24.5; 7-10 gallon capacity 500/case 45 cases
per 
case

6 Disinfectant Bathroom Cleaner: Non-Acid Bowl & Bath 3 x 1 gallon 35 cases
per 
case

Brand: P&G Comet Disinfectant /case

ID# 20542 (no substitute)

7 Disinfectant cleaner Kaibosh 4 gallons 10 cases
per 
case

Brand: KAIVAC - ID# KBOSH (no substitute) /case

8 Disinfectant Spray 12 oz can 27 cases
per 
case

12 oz can

12/case

=144 oz/cs

27 cases = 3,888 oz total needed

9
Disinfectant Wipes: 70/container @ 12 per case (840 total wipes) * 
33 cases = 27,720 wipes

33 cases
per 
case

10 Floor Conditioner & Neutralizer 1 oz packs 10 cases
per 
case

Brand: Stearns - ID# ST729 (no substitute) 72/case

11 Floor Finish 5 gallon 775 gallons
per 

gallon
Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra (no substitute) box

12 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep - MAROON - 14"x20" 10/case 15 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute) - ID# 51111 025901

13 Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep - MAROON - 20" 10/case 20 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)  



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m. All American Poly Calico Packaging
Central Poly Bag 

Corporation
Chemcraft Industries

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

14 Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, without powder, hospital grade: LARGE 100 gloves/box 20 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 23.80 $476.00

10 boxes/case

15
Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, without powder, hospital grade: EX-
LARGE

100 gloves/box 20 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid $0.00 24.00 $480.00

10 boxes/case

16 Pencil Sharpeners each 48 each
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid no bid

Brand: KS (No Substitute) - ID# 1031

17 Roll Towels Six 270 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid 21.77     $5,877.90 15.35 $4,144.50

Brand: NPS or equal 8"x800' rolls

ID# 30700 (Sample must be included with bid) /case

18 Roll Towel 8" Dispenser - White each 4 each
per 

each
no bid no bid 50.00     $200.00 no bid

Brand: Palmer

ID# 56701  (no substitute)

19 Rubbermaid/Brute 44 gallon container each 12 each
per 

each
no bid no bid no bid 49.20 $590.40

Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute

ID# 2643 (no substitute)

20 Rubbermaid/Brute Dolly each 12 each
per 

each
no bid no bid no bid 50.88 $610.56

Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute

ID# 2640 (no substitute)

21 Sanitary Napkins - Brand:  Hospital 200/case 8 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 51.40 $411.20

Specialty Maxithins - ID# MT200

22 Sanitizer, Foaming Hand, BAG for wall-mount dispenser 1,000 ml, 33.8 oz 40 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid no bid

Brand: Pro Source 8/case

ID# 6585M3PB (no substitute)

23 Sanitary Napkin Disposal Kraft Bags - 11x7x3-1/2  Wax 500/case 6 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 17.60 $105.60

24 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming 1,000 ml/bag 150 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid no bid

Brand: InoDerm 6 bags/case

ID# 5080-FL1000 (no substitute)

25 Sponges, Scrubbing 20/case 21 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 28.85 $605.85

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite - ID# 749 (no substitute)

26 Sponges, Magic Eraser 4 pads/box 20 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 20.93 $418.60

Brand: Proctor & Gamble Mr. Clean 6 boxes/case

ID# PGc82028 (no substitute)

27
Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes - at 
least 40/tub & 6 tubs/case (240 wipes/cs)

40 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid $1,169.09

Your pack: 51.15 $2,046.00

=240 wipes/cs 6/cs

40 cases = 9,600 wipes total needed 70 tub

.12178 ea



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m.

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

14 Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, without powder, hospital grade: LARGE 100 gloves/box 20 cases
per 
case

10 boxes/case

15
Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, without powder, hospital grade: EX-
LARGE

100 gloves/box 20 cases
per 
case

10 boxes/case

16 Pencil Sharpeners each 48 each
per 
case

Brand: KS (No Substitute) - ID# 1031

17 Roll Towels Six 270 cases
per 
case

Brand: NPS or equal 8"x800' rolls

ID# 30700 (Sample must be included with bid) /case

18 Roll Towel 8" Dispenser - White each 4 each
per 

each
Brand: Palmer

ID# 56701  (no substitute)

19 Rubbermaid/Brute 44 gallon container each 12 each
per 

each
Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute

ID# 2643 (no substitute)

20 Rubbermaid/Brute Dolly each 12 each
per 

each
Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute

ID# 2640 (no substitute)

21 Sanitary Napkins - Brand:  Hospital 200/case 8 cases
per 
case

Specialty Maxithins - ID# MT200

22 Sanitizer, Foaming Hand, BAG for wall-mount dispenser 1,000 ml, 33.8 oz 40 cases
per 
case

Brand: Pro Source 8/case

ID# 6585M3PB (no substitute)

23 Sanitary Napkin Disposal Kraft Bags - 11x7x3-1/2  Wax 500/case 6 cases
per 
case

24 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming 1,000 ml/bag 150 cases
per 
case

Brand: InoDerm 6 bags/case

ID# 5080-FL1000 (no substitute)

25 Sponges, Scrubbing 20/case 21 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite - ID# 749 (no substitute)

26 Sponges, Magic Eraser 4 pads/box 20 cases
per 
case

Brand: Proctor & Gamble Mr. Clean 6 boxes/case

ID# PGc82028 (no substitute)

27
Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes - at 
least 40/tub & 6 tubs/case (240 wipes/cs)

40 cases
per 
case

Your pack:

=240 wipes/cs

40 cases = 9,600 wipes total needed

Cicero Mfg. & Supply Company Dash Medical Gloves Expert Chemical Supply Ferguson Facilities Supply

25.10 $502.00 23.50     $470.00 no bid 27.46 $549.20

25.10 $502.00 23.50     $470.00 no bid 27.46 $549.20

12.56 $602.88 no bid no bid no bid

23.47 $6,336.90 no bid 14.85      $4,009.50 16.69 $4,506.30

54.95 $219.80 no bid no bid no bid

53.80 $645.60 no bid no bid 62.32 $747.84

49.43 $593.16 no bid no bid 44.14 $529.68

52.44 $419.52 no bid no bid 31.57 $252.56

105.00 $4,200.00 no bid no bid no bid

19.05 $114.30 no bid no bid 14.20 $85.20

49.00 $7,350.00 no bid 22.50      $3,375.00 no bid

36.92 $775.32 no bid no bid 28.44 $597.24

41.05 $821.00 no bid no bid 21.48 $429.60

$2,428.80 no bid no bid $1,645.44

60.74 $2,429.60 41.15 1,646.00                                      

6/cs 6/cs

40.00 tub 40 tub

.2530 ea .1714 ea



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m.

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

14 Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, without powder, hospital grade: LARGE 100 gloves/box 20 cases
per 
case

10 boxes/case

15
Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, without powder, hospital grade: EX-
LARGE

100 gloves/box 20 cases
per 
case

10 boxes/case

16 Pencil Sharpeners each 48 each
per 
case

Brand: KS (No Substitute) - ID# 1031

17 Roll Towels Six 270 cases
per 
case

Brand: NPS or equal 8"x800' rolls

ID# 30700 (Sample must be included with bid) /case

18 Roll Towel 8" Dispenser - White each 4 each
per 

each
Brand: Palmer

ID# 56701  (no substitute)

19 Rubbermaid/Brute 44 gallon container each 12 each
per 

each
Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute

ID# 2643 (no substitute)

20 Rubbermaid/Brute Dolly each 12 each
per 

each
Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute

ID# 2640 (no substitute)

21 Sanitary Napkins - Brand:  Hospital 200/case 8 cases
per 
case

Specialty Maxithins - ID# MT200

22 Sanitizer, Foaming Hand, BAG for wall-mount dispenser 1,000 ml, 33.8 oz 40 cases
per 
case

Brand: Pro Source 8/case

ID# 6585M3PB (no substitute)

23 Sanitary Napkin Disposal Kraft Bags - 11x7x3-1/2  Wax 500/case 6 cases
per 
case

24 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming 1,000 ml/bag 150 cases
per 
case

Brand: InoDerm 6 bags/case

ID# 5080-FL1000 (no substitute)

25 Sponges, Scrubbing 20/case 21 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite - ID# 749 (no substitute)

26 Sponges, Magic Eraser 4 pads/box 20 cases
per 
case

Brand: Proctor & Gamble Mr. Clean 6 boxes/case

ID# PGc82028 (no substitute)

27
Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes - at 
least 40/tub & 6 tubs/case (240 wipes/cs)

40 cases
per 
case

Your pack:

=240 wipes/cs

40 cases = 9,600 wipes total needed

Interborough Packaging LaPorte, Inc. North American Pro Source Pyramid School Products

18.50       $370.00 no bid no bid 21.99 $439.80 22.70 $454.00

18.50       $370.00 no bid no bid 21.99 $439.80 22.70 $454.00

no bid no bid no bid no bid 7.29 $349.92

no bid 14.29     $3,858.30 17.28      $4,665.60 12.70 $3,429.00 no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid 41.23     $1,791.03 no bid 42.24 $506.88 39.98 $479.76

no bid no bid no bid 41.00 $492.00 27.98 $335.76

no bid no bid 52.63      $421.04 59.00 $472.00 29.98 $239.84

no bid 35.91     $1,436.40 no bid 69.90 $2,796.00 no bid

no bid no bid 14.95      $89.70 16.48 $98.88 13.35 $80.10

no bid 22.75     $3,412.50 no bid 21.50 $3,225.00 31.98 $4,797.00

no bid no bid no bid 23.00 $483.00 36.98 $776.58

no bid no bid 22.02      $440.40 38.49 $769.80 30.98 $619.60

no bid no bid no bid no bid $1,821.98

45.55 1,822.00                                    

6/cs

40 tub

.18979 ea



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m.

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

14 Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, without powder, hospital grade: LARGE 100 gloves/box 20 cases
per 
case

10 boxes/case

15
Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, without powder, hospital grade: EX-
LARGE

100 gloves/box 20 cases
per 
case

10 boxes/case

16 Pencil Sharpeners each 48 each
per 
case

Brand: KS (No Substitute) - ID# 1031

17 Roll Towels Six 270 cases
per 
case

Brand: NPS or equal 8"x800' rolls

ID# 30700 (Sample must be included with bid) /case

18 Roll Towel 8" Dispenser - White each 4 each
per 

each
Brand: Palmer

ID# 56701  (no substitute)

19 Rubbermaid/Brute 44 gallon container each 12 each
per 

each
Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute

ID# 2643 (no substitute)

20 Rubbermaid/Brute Dolly each 12 each
per 

each
Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute

ID# 2640 (no substitute)

21 Sanitary Napkins - Brand:  Hospital 200/case 8 cases
per 
case

Specialty Maxithins - ID# MT200

22 Sanitizer, Foaming Hand, BAG for wall-mount dispenser 1,000 ml, 33.8 oz 40 cases
per 
case

Brand: Pro Source 8/case

ID# 6585M3PB (no substitute)

23 Sanitary Napkin Disposal Kraft Bags - 11x7x3-1/2  Wax 500/case 6 cases
per 
case

24 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming 1,000 ml/bag 150 cases
per 
case

Brand: InoDerm 6 bags/case

ID# 5080-FL1000 (no substitute)

25 Sponges, Scrubbing 20/case 21 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite - ID# 749 (no substitute)

26 Sponges, Magic Eraser 4 pads/box 20 cases
per 
case

Brand: Proctor & Gamble Mr. Clean 6 boxes/case

ID# PGc82028 (no substitute)

27
Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes - at 
least 40/tub & 6 tubs/case (240 wipes/cs)

40 cases
per 
case

Your pack:

=240 wipes/cs

40 cases = 9,600 wipes total needed

Ramrod Distributors, Inc.
The Standard 

Companies
Unipak Valdes LLC Warehouse Direct

26.20 $524.00 24.71 $494.20 no bid no bid 22.90 $458.00

26.20 $524.00 24.71 $494.20 no bid no bid 22.90 $458.00

13.00 $624.00 no bid no bid no bid 7.73 $371.04

15.25 $4,117.50 18.24 $4,924.80 no bid 13.50     $3,645.00 16.79 $4,533.30

59.85 $239.40 no bid no bid no bid 19.61 $78.44

27.50 $330.00 53.47 $641.64 no bid no bid 43.44 $521.28

28.04 $336.48 55.29 $663.48 no bid no bid 45.95 $551.40

32.75 $262.00 32.47 $259.76 no bid no bid 29.50 $236.00

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

13.90 $83.40 14.00 $84.00 no bid no bid 13.20 $79.20

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

21.52 $451.92 32.00 $672.00 no bid no bid 35.86 $753.06

no bid 23.65 $473.00 no bid no bid 23.49 $469.80

$1,832.74 $1,252.80 no bid no bid $1,368.67

45.82 $1,832.80 46.98 $1,879.20 59.88 2,395.20                    

6/cs 6/cs 6/cs

40 tub 40 tub 70 tub

.19091 ea .1305 ea .14257 ea



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m.

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

14 Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, without powder, hospital grade: LARGE 100 gloves/box 20 cases
per 
case

10 boxes/case

15
Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, without powder, hospital grade: EX-
LARGE

100 gloves/box 20 cases
per 
case

10 boxes/case

16 Pencil Sharpeners each 48 each
per 
case

Brand: KS (No Substitute) - ID# 1031

17 Roll Towels Six 270 cases
per 
case

Brand: NPS or equal 8"x800' rolls

ID# 30700 (Sample must be included with bid) /case

18 Roll Towel 8" Dispenser - White each 4 each
per 

each
Brand: Palmer

ID# 56701  (no substitute)

19 Rubbermaid/Brute 44 gallon container each 12 each
per 

each
Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute

ID# 2643 (no substitute)

20 Rubbermaid/Brute Dolly each 12 each
per 

each
Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute

ID# 2640 (no substitute)

21 Sanitary Napkins - Brand:  Hospital 200/case 8 cases
per 
case

Specialty Maxithins - ID# MT200

22 Sanitizer, Foaming Hand, BAG for wall-mount dispenser 1,000 ml, 33.8 oz 40 cases
per 
case

Brand: Pro Source 8/case

ID# 6585M3PB (no substitute)

23 Sanitary Napkin Disposal Kraft Bags - 11x7x3-1/2  Wax 500/case 6 cases
per 
case

24 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming 1,000 ml/bag 150 cases
per 
case

Brand: InoDerm 6 bags/case

ID# 5080-FL1000 (no substitute)

25 Sponges, Scrubbing 20/case 21 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite - ID# 749 (no substitute)

26 Sponges, Magic Eraser 4 pads/box 20 cases
per 
case

Brand: Proctor & Gamble Mr. Clean 6 boxes/case

ID# PGc82028 (no substitute)

27
Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes - at 
least 40/tub & 6 tubs/case (240 wipes/cs)

40 cases
per 
case

Your pack:

=240 wipes/cs

40 cases = 9,600 wipes total needed



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m. All American Poly Calico Packaging
Central Poly Bag 

Corporation
Chemcraft Industries

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

28 Tissue, facial, 2 ply 100/box 240 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid 14.90     $3,576.00 12.75 $3,060.00

30 boxes/cs

29 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para 12/case 60 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 12.70 $762.00

30
Wet Mop Heads - Web Foot -
for waxing - 100% rayon 24 oz.

10 dozen
per 

dozen
no bid no bid no bid 57.90 $579.00

31 13” round white pads 5 pads/case 5 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 12.00 $60.00

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

32 19-20” round white pads 5 pads/case 5 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 23.19 $115.95

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

33 19-20” round red pads 5 pads/case 10 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid 23.19 $231.90

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

34 Floor Stripper 5 gal. box/pail 40 gallons per box no bid no bid no bid no bid

Brand:  Johnson’s Bravo (no substitute)

35 Doodlebug 8550 10 per box 20 boxes per box no bid no bid no bid 21.29 $425.80

Brand:  3M (no substitute)

36 Pro Line Finished Floor Cleaner  2 -1 gallon/case 20 cases
per 
case

no bid no bid no bid no bid

Brand:  P&G

37 Vacuum 10 each no bid no bid no bid 149.00 $1,490.00

Brand: Clear Max Pro-Series Vacuum 
GRAND TOTAL BY VENDOR $0.00 $0.00 $6,998.89



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m.

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

28 Tissue, facial, 2 ply 100/box 240 cases
per 
case

30 boxes/cs

29 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para 12/case 60 cases
per 
case

30
Wet Mop Heads - Web Foot -
for waxing - 100% rayon 24 oz.

10 dozen
per 

dozen

31 13” round white pads 5 pads/case 5 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

32 19-20” round white pads 5 pads/case 5 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

33 19-20” round red pads 5 pads/case 10 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

34 Floor Stripper 5 gal. box/pail 40 gallons per box

Brand:  Johnson’s Bravo (no substitute)

35 Doodlebug 8550 10 per box 20 boxes per box

Brand:  3M (no substitute)

36 Pro Line Finished Floor Cleaner  2 -1 gallon/case 20 cases
per 
case

Brand:  P&G

37 Vacuum 10 each

Brand: Clear Max Pro-Series Vacuum 
GRAND TOTAL BY VENDOR

Cicero Mfg. & Supply Company Dash Medical Gloves Expert Chemical Supply Ferguson Facilities Supply

16.65 $3,996.00 no bid no bid 15.78 $3,787.20

15.65 $939.00 no bid no bid 13.44 $806.40

90.89 $908.90 no bid no bid 55.01 $550.10

18.32 $91.60 no bid no bid 11.46 $57.30

33.75 $168.75 no bid no bid 22.95 $114.75

33.38 $333.80 no bid no bid 20.06 $200.60

86.06 $3,442.40 no bid no bid 39.36 $1,574.40

28.12 $562.40 no bid no bid 28.10 $562.00

48.41 $968.20 no bid no bid no bid

299.00 $2,990.00 no bid no bid no bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m.

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

28 Tissue, facial, 2 ply 100/box 240 cases
per 
case

30 boxes/cs

29 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para 12/case 60 cases
per 
case

30
Wet Mop Heads - Web Foot -
for waxing - 100% rayon 24 oz.

10 dozen
per 

dozen

31 13” round white pads 5 pads/case 5 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

32 19-20” round white pads 5 pads/case 5 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

33 19-20” round red pads 5 pads/case 10 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

34 Floor Stripper 5 gal. box/pail 40 gallons per box

Brand:  Johnson’s Bravo (no substitute)

35 Doodlebug 8550 10 per box 20 boxes per box

Brand:  3M (no substitute)

36 Pro Line Finished Floor Cleaner  2 -1 gallon/case 20 cases
per 
case

Brand:  P&G

37 Vacuum 10 each

Brand: Clear Max Pro-Series Vacuum 
GRAND TOTAL BY VENDOR

Interborough Packaging LaPorte, Inc. North American Pro Source Pyramid School Products

no bid 14.91     $3,578.40 17.56      $4,214.40 11.25 $2,700.00 17.98 $4,315.20

no bid no bid 10.78      $646.80 13.00 $780.00 10.55 $633.00

no bid no bid no bid 59.00 $590.00 46.68 $466.80

no bid no bid no bid 18.99 $94.95 17.99 $89.95

no bid no bid no bid 33.40 $167.00 33.95 $169.75

no bid no bid no bid 33.90 $339.00 33.98 $339.80

no bid no bid no bid 46.60 $1,864.00 no bid

no bid no bid no bid 69.40 $1,388.00 30.99 $619.80

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid 249.00 $2,490.00 no bid

$740.00 $1,436.40 $0.00 $20,653.30 $2,206.36



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m.

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

28 Tissue, facial, 2 ply 100/box 240 cases
per 
case

30 boxes/cs

29 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para 12/case 60 cases
per 
case

30
Wet Mop Heads - Web Foot -
for waxing - 100% rayon 24 oz.

10 dozen
per 

dozen

31 13” round white pads 5 pads/case 5 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

32 19-20” round white pads 5 pads/case 5 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

33 19-20” round red pads 5 pads/case 10 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

34 Floor Stripper 5 gal. box/pail 40 gallons per box

Brand:  Johnson’s Bravo (no substitute)

35 Doodlebug 8550 10 per box 20 boxes per box

Brand:  3M (no substitute)

36 Pro Line Finished Floor Cleaner  2 -1 gallon/case 20 cases
per 
case

Brand:  P&G

37 Vacuum 10 each

Brand: Clear Max Pro-Series Vacuum 
GRAND TOTAL BY VENDOR

Ramrod Distributors, Inc.
The Standard 

Companies
Unipak Valdes LLC Warehouse Direct

12.55 $3,012.00 18.53 $4,447.20 no bid no bid 14.23 $3,415.20

12.51 $750.60 12.35 $741.00 no bid no bid 14.95 $897.00

69.00 $690.00 74.55 $745.50 no bid no bid 68.40 $684.00

8.30 $41.50 13.36 $66.80 no bid no bid 17.00 $85.00

14.80 $74.00 25.49 $127.45 no bid no bid 32.06 $160.30

14.80 $148.00 25.49 $254.90 no bid no bid 32.00 $320.00

7.20 $288.00 10.73 $429.20 no bid no bid 38.80 $1,552.00

16.80 $336.00 23.40 $468.00 no bid no bid 120.25 $2,405.00

38.80 $776.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

181.00a $1,181.00 no bid no bid no bid 155.00 $1,550.00

152.00 b $1,152.00

$12,998.67 $0.00 $5,254.70 $0.00 $1,019.44



Custodial Supplies Bid - Opened Thursday, April 4, 2019 @ 3:30 p.m.

ITEM
NO. Item Description PACK TOTAL

28 Tissue, facial, 2 ply 100/box 240 cases
per 
case

30 boxes/cs

29 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para 12/case 60 cases
per 
case

30
Wet Mop Heads - Web Foot -
for waxing - 100% rayon 24 oz.

10 dozen
per 

dozen

31 13” round white pads 5 pads/case 5 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

32 19-20” round white pads 5 pads/case 5 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

33 19-20” round red pads 5 pads/case 10 cases
per 
case

Brand: 3M (no substitute)

34 Floor Stripper 5 gal. box/pail 40 gallons per box

Brand:  Johnson’s Bravo (no substitute)

35 Doodlebug 8550 10 per box 20 boxes per box

Brand:  3M (no substitute)

36 Pro Line Finished Floor Cleaner  2 -1 gallon/case 20 cases
per 
case

Brand:  P&G

37 Vacuum 10 each

Brand: Clear Max Pro-Series Vacuum 
GRAND TOTAL BY VENDOR
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