EXHIBIT - A

Chromebook Device RFP Opened Friday April 5, 2019 @ 3:00 p.m.

1A: Dell Chromebook 5190
1B: HP Chromebook 11A G6 EE
1C: Lenovo 100e Chromebook

Chromebooks
Unit Price Total
Vendor Quantity
Aspire Global Solutions 2300 1A No Bid
Lombard, IL 2300 1B No Bid
2300 1C $236.40 $543,720.00
Cadence Exchange 2300 1A $295.00 $678,500.00
Downers Grove, IL 2300 1B No Bid
2300 1C $250.00 $575,000.00
Troxell Communications Inc 2300 1A No Bid
Evergreen Park, IL 2300 1B No Bid
2300 1C $240.60 $553,380.00
AKA Comp Solutions 2300 1A $295.39 $679,397.00
Chicago, IL 2300 1B $256.20 $589,260.00
2300 1C $249.47 $573,781.00
Firefly Computers 2300 1A No Bid
Saint Paul, MN 2300 1B $222.85 $512,555.00
2300 1C $231.85 $533,255.00
SHI International Corp 2300 1A No Bid
Somerset, NJ 2300 1B $218.67 $502,941.00
2300 1C No Bid
CDW-G 2300 1A $274.22 $630,706.00
Vernon Hills, IL 2300 1B $188.37 $433,251.00
2300 1C $239.24 $550,252.00
Y & S Technologies 2300 1A No Bid
Brooklyn, NY 2300 1B No Bid
2300 1C $226.00 $519,800.00
RCN Technologies 2300 1A No Bid
Knoxville, TN 2300 1B $259.45 $596,735.00
2300 1C No Bid
Trinity Technology 2300 1A No Bid
Saint Paul, MN 2300 1B No Bid
2300 1C $214.00 $492,200.00
COTG 2300 1A No Bid
Bolingbrook, IL 2300 1B $217.34 $499,882.00
2300 1C No Bid
Diltex Inc. 2300 1A No Bid
West Covina, CA 2300 1B $209.67 $482,241.00
2300 1C No Bid
Howard Technology Solutions 2300 1A $435.00 $1,000,500.00
Laurel, MS 2300 1B $260.00 $598,000.00
2300 1C $291.00 $669,300.00
IT Savvy 2300 1A No Bid
Addison, IL 2300 1B $206.41 S474,743.00
2300 1C No Bid
Riverside Technologies 2300 1A No Bid
North Sioux City, SD 2300 1B $205.00 $471,500.00
2300 1C No Bid
Sunrise Hitek 2300 1A No Bid
Chicago, IL 2300 1B No Bid
2300 1C No Bid
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