
ITEM

NO.
P A C K DO AT

ship to

AT e+f
WB

1 Bathroom Tissue 96/case 12 175 187 175 362 cases NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand: National NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 832

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength six 1 gal. 0 55 55 40 95 cases 8.12        9.98          6.50       11.85     

Brand: /case

ID#

3 each 0 0 0 12 12 each 2.73        1.98          NO BID 3.20       

Brand:   

ID# 

4 each 0 12 12 12 24 each 6.09        5.14          NO BID 5.65       

Brand:   

ID# 

5 Broom Handles, Screw Type-5' wood 2/3" die cast aluminum tipeach 0 6 6 6 12 each 3.07        2.34          NO BID 4.98       

Brand:   

ID# 

6 Buckets, Janitor - 14 qt. each 0 10 10 0 10 each 7.93        8.38          6.75       7.80       

Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute OR EQUAL

ID# 2614

7 Can Liners, Polyethylene: .7 mil; 43 x 48, 2 ply; 55 gal cap100/case   20 275 295 160 455 cases 13.47      4,022.20    8.84          NO BID 20.32     

Brand: 100/case 100/case 100/case

ID# 0.1347    0.0884      0.2032   

8 Can Liners, Polyethylene: .9 mil; 30 x 36; 20-30 gal cap 250/case 12 30 42 35 77 cases NO BID 14.82        NO BID 18.42     

Brand: 250/case 250/case

ID# 0.0593      0.0737   

9 Can Liners, Polyethylene: .35 mil; 22.5 x 24.5; 7-10 gal cap500/case 2 10 12 10 22 cases 16.10      11.47        NO BID 10.02     

Brand: 1000/case 500/case 500/case

ID# 0.01610  0.0229      0.0200   

10 Carpet Shampoo: Extraction - Heavy Soil 4 gallons 0 5 5 0 5 cases 38.92      NO BID 28.50     36.08     

Brand: /case 0.0760    stain-resist:1/2 oz/g

ID# 512 oz/cs non-stain-resist:2 oz/g

Dilution: 4 oz/gal 1:32 to 1:64

11 Cloths, terry towel 12 x 18 bound 25 lb pack 0 10 10 5 15 packs NO BID 62.98        NO BID 764.55    50.97     

Brand: 132 rags

ID# /pack

12 Cloths,Treated Cleaning  24 x 24 100/pack 0 25 25 20 45 cases 78.24      NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand: 12 packs 12/100 count

ID# /case 0.0652    

13 Disinfectant spray 12/case 2 15 17 15 32 cases 37.73      NO BID 24.50     76.20     

Brand: Lysol OR EQUAL

ID#

14 Disinfectant wipes        70/container or better 12 per case 0 45 45 50 95 cases 36.00      NO BID 24.75     67.08     

Brand: (840 wipes 6/75tub/cs 6/75tub/cs 12/70tub/cs

ID# per case) 0.0800    0.0550   0.0799   

15 Dust Mop Treatment - low odor - waterbase 5 gallon pails 0 0 0 15 15 gallons 82.05         5.47        NO BID NO BID per 5 gal 92.35     

Brand: ONLY per gal = 18.47     

ID#

16 Dust Mop Heads w/snaps 18" 0 3 3 0 3 dozen 88.32      101.94       33.98        NO BID 37.08     

Brand:

ID# 

17 Duster, ostrich feather 24 24 24 4 dozen NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand: American NO SUBSTITUTE (2 dz) (2 dz) (2 dz)

ID#: 921482

18 Flags, American, Classroom Size: 16" x 24" 0 12 12 12 24 each NO BID NO BID 115.20       4.80       NO BID

Brand:

ID#

19 Floor Finish 0 350 350 275 625 gallons 12.60      NO BID NO BID per 5 gal 89.56     

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra NO SUBSTITUTE per 1 gal 17.912   

ID#

20 Floor Sealer 0 20 20 20 40 gallons 15.40      NO BID NO BID per 5 gal 108.77   

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Plaza NO SUBSTITUTE per 1 gal 21.754   

ID#

21 Floor Stripper 0 40 40 40 80 gallons 8.20        NO BID NO BID per 5 gal 60.77     

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Bravo NO SUBSTITUTE per 1 gal 12.154   

ID#

BOARD OF EDUCATION

AmSan Calico Expert Chemical Grainger
DuPAGE HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 88

DuPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

PROJECT: To provide and deliver custodial supplies to Addison Trail & Willowbrook High Schools

TOTAL

Broom, Counter - 8"

Broom, Corn, Warehouse Heavy-Duty angle

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N



ITEM

NO.
P A C K

1 Bathroom Tissue 96/case

Brand: National NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 832

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength six 1 gal.

Brand: /case

ID#

3 each

Brand: 

ID# 

4 each

Brand: 

ID# 

5 Broom Handles, Screw Type-5' wood 2/3" die cast aluminum tipeach

Brand: 

ID# 

6 Buckets, Janitor - 14 qt. each

Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute OR EQUAL

ID# 2614

7 Can Liners, Polyethylene: .7 mil; 43 x 48, 2 ply; 55 gal cap100/case   

Brand:

ID# 

8 Can Liners, Polyethylene: .9 mil; 30 x 36; 20-30 gal cap 250/case

Brand:

ID#

9 Can Liners, Polyethylene: .35 mil; 22.5 x 24.5; 7-10 gal cap500/case 

Brand:

ID#

10 Carpet Shampoo: Extraction - Heavy Soil 4 gallons

Brand: /case

ID# 512 oz/cs

Dilution:

11 Cloths, terry towel 12 x 18 bound 25 lb pack

Brand: 132 rags

ID# /pack

12 Cloths,Treated Cleaning  24 x 24 100/pack

Brand: 12 packs

ID# /case

13 Disinfectant spray 12/case

Brand: Lysol OR EQUAL

ID#

14 Disinfectant wipes        70/container or better 12 per case

Brand: (840 wipes

ID# per case)

15 Dust Mop Treatment - low odor - waterbase 5 gallon pails 

Brand: ONLY

ID#

16 Dust Mop Heads w/snaps 18"

Brand:

ID# 

17 Duster, ostrich feather

Brand: American NO SUBSTITUTE

ID#: 921482

18 Flags, American, Classroom Size: 16" x 24"

Brand:

ID#

19 Floor Finish 

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra NO SUBSTITUTE

ID#

20 Floor Sealer 

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Plaza NO SUBSTITUTE

ID#

21 Floor Stripper

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Bravo NO SUBSTITUTE

ID#

BOARD OF EDUCATION

DuPAGE HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 88

DuPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

PROJECT: To provide and deliver custodial supplies to Addison Trail & Willowbrook High Schools

Broom, Counter - 8"

Broom, Corn, Warehouse Heavy-Duty angle

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N

NO BID NO BID NO BID 29.00     NO BID NO BID

7.02       5.78       NO BID 6.00       533.90      5.62       11.85     

2.26       2.42       23.28       1.94       3.35       3.19       6.47       

6.61       4.61       4.89       102.00         4.25       NO BID 9.62       

25.20        2.10       2.17       2.28       2.48       3.22       3.11       

7.28       6.00       53.90       5.39       7.00       11.66     17.47     

NO BID 10.53     NO BID 13.80     10.65     16.91     

100/case 100/case 100/case 100/case

0.1053   0.1380   0.1065   0.1691   

NO BID 13.75     NO BID 17.00     16.92     21.88     

250/case 250/case 250/case 250/case

0.0550   0.0680   0.0677   0.0875   

NO BID 8.58       NO BID 9.05       176.88      8.04       9.04       

500/case 500/case 500/case 500/case

0.0172   0.0181   0.01608 0.0181   

25.89     40.81     NO BID 110.00         22.00     NO BID 68.04     

12.95     1/2 oz/gal

4 gal/cs 4 gal/cs

/2 oz 1:256

NO BID NO BID NO BID 51.80     NO BID NO BID

1,551.60   34.48     NO BID 69.50     55.00     NO BID 63.77     

12/100 count 10/50 count 12/100 count 12/100 count

0.0287   1.3900   0.0458   0.0531   

25.51     580.48    18.14     22.94     26.00     64.88     35.15     

(12)16.5

oz/case

28.21     NO BID 29.15     27.75     26.77     28.67     

12/70tub/cs 6/80tub/cs 6/75tub/cs 6/75tub/cs 12/70tub/cs

0.0336   0.0607   0.0617   0.0595   0.0341   

5.55       NO BID NO BID 5.94       NO BID NO BID

77.84     41.47     45.84     40.00     NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID 192.00         48.00     NO BID 48.88     

8.74       NO BID 4.89       NO BID NO BID NO BID

11.81     14.366   NO BID 6,156.25      9.85       NO BID per 5 gal 76.10     

per 1 gal 15.22     

579.60      14.49     17.562   NO BID 18.25     NO BID per 5 gal 94.26     

per 1 gal 18.85     

619.20      7.74       9.566     NO BID 8.25       NO BID 50.34     

HP Products Laport Pyramid Ramrod Runge Staples



ITEM

NO.
P A C K

1 Bathroom Tissue 96/case

Brand: National NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 832

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength six 1 gal.

Brand: /case

ID#

3 each

Brand: 

ID# 

4 each

Brand: 

ID# 

5 Broom Handles, Screw Type-5' wood 2/3" die cast aluminum tipeach

Brand: 

ID# 

6 Buckets, Janitor - 14 qt. each

Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute OR EQUAL

ID# 2614

7 Can Liners, Polyethylene: .7 mil; 43 x 48, 2 ply; 55 gal cap100/case   

Brand:

ID# 

8 Can Liners, Polyethylene: .9 mil; 30 x 36; 20-30 gal cap 250/case

Brand:

ID#

9 Can Liners, Polyethylene: .35 mil; 22.5 x 24.5; 7-10 gal cap500/case 

Brand:

ID#

10 Carpet Shampoo: Extraction - Heavy Soil 4 gallons

Brand: /case

ID# 512 oz/cs

Dilution:

11 Cloths, terry towel 12 x 18 bound 25 lb pack

Brand: 132 rags

ID# /pack

12 Cloths,Treated Cleaning  24 x 24 100/pack

Brand: 12 packs

ID# /case

13 Disinfectant spray 12/case

Brand: Lysol OR EQUAL

ID#

14 Disinfectant wipes        70/container or better 12 per case

Brand: (840 wipes

ID# per case)

15 Dust Mop Treatment - low odor - waterbase 5 gallon pails 

Brand: ONLY

ID#

16 Dust Mop Heads w/snaps 18"

Brand:

ID# 

17 Duster, ostrich feather

Brand: American NO SUBSTITUTE

ID#: 921482

18 Flags, American, Classroom Size: 16" x 24"

Brand:

ID#

19 Floor Finish 

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra NO SUBSTITUTE

ID#

20 Floor Sealer 

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Plaza NO SUBSTITUTE

ID#

21 Floor Stripper

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Bravo NO SUBSTITUTE

ID#

BOARD OF EDUCATION

DuPAGE HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 88

DuPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

PROJECT: To provide and deliver custodial supplies to Addison Trail & Willowbrook High Schools

Broom, Counter - 8"

Broom, Corn, Warehouse Heavy-Duty angle

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N

NO BID 29.89       10,403.88  28.74      NO BID

NO BID 9.94         8.50        10.50     

NO BID 3.48         3.75        5.52       

NO BID 5.50         NO BID 8.90       

NO BID 3.90         NO BID 4.45       

NO BID 11.80       NO BID 11.71     

NO BID 13.56       10.84      13.85     

100/case 100/case 100/case

0.1356     0.1084    0.1385   

NO BID 803.88      10.44       14.75      19.05     

250/case 250/case 200/case

0.0418     0.0590    0.0953   

NO BID 10.90       10.90      20.30     

500/case 500/case 1000/case

0.0218     0.0218    0.0203   

NO BID 41.60       NO BID 38.25     

1:256

NO BID 82.55       NO BID NO BID

25 lb/pk

NO BID 44.55       NO BID NO BID

12/100 count

0.0371     

NO BID Lysol 67.54       59.99      29.65     

Claire 27.96       

NO BID 27.46       2,611.55    27.49      18.80     

6/75tub/cs 12/70tub/cs 6/75tub/cs

0.0610     0.0327    0.0418   

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID 42.48       NO BID 68.50     

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID 19.98       11.24      15.05     

NO BID 24.60       NO BID 18.39     

NO BID 12.85       8.60        10.45     

Tri-State

Surgical
Unique Products Valdes Xpedx



ITEM

NO.
P A C K DO AT

ship to

AT e+f
WB

BOARD OF EDUCATION

AmSan Calico Expert Chemical Grainger
DuPAGE HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 88

DuPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

PROJECT: To provide and deliver custodial supplies to Addison Trail & Willowbrook High Schools

TOTALI T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N

22
Floor Pads, 14" x 20"

strip surface preparation
BROWN 10/case 0 25 25 25 50 cases

118.50    NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE 10/case

ID#

23 Floor Pads, Brown   20/case 0 5 5 5 10 cases 8.47        NO BID NO BID 8.50       

Brand: 3M Doodle Bug NO SUBSTITUTE 5/case 5/case

ID# 8541 1.6940    1.7000   

24 Floor Pads, White 20/case 0 8 8 5 13 cases 33.85      NO BID NO BID 110.37    8.49       

Brand: 3M Doodle Bug NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 8440

25 Floor Pad Holder each 0 12 12 0 12 each 16.56      NO BID NO BID 39.48      3.29       

Brand:3M InstaLok Doodlebug NO SUBSTITUTE

ID#

26 Floor Machine Pads RED - 16" 5 pads 3 0 3 8 11 cases 19.90      NO BID NO BID 20.04     

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

27 Floor Machine Pads WHITE - 16" 5 pads 1 0 1 4 5 cases 19.90      NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

28 Floor Machine Pads RED - 13" 5 pads 0 6 6 0 6 cases 14.29      NO BID NO BID 15.03     

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

29 Floor Machine Pads WHITE - 13" 5 pads 0 4 4 0 4 cases 14.29      NO BID NO BID 15.01     

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

30 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: LARGE 12 boxes 0 10 10 10 20 cases NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand: PRO LINK Latex NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

31 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: EX-LARGE 12 boxes 0 8 8 10 18 cases NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand: PRO LINK Latex NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

32 Gloves, Vinyl Flock-Lined Large 12 boxes 0 10 10 5 15 cases NO BID 74.88        NO BID 22.65     

Brand: /case 288/case 50 gloves/cs

ID# 0.2600      0.4530   

33 Gloves, Vinyl Flock-Lined Ex-Large 12 boxes 0 8 8 5 13 cases NO BID 74.88        NO BID 22.65     

Brand: /case 288/case 50gloves/cs

ID# 0.2600      0.4530   

34 Gum Freeze 12 oz cans 20 20 20 40 cases 26.90      NO BID 20.04     26.04     

Brand: 12 cans/case

ID#

35 J-Fill Glass Cleaner 2 - 84.5 oz 0 6 6 6 12 cases 48.55      NO BID NO BID 76.94     

Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE containers

ID# /case

36 Mop Bucket, 44 qt. with wringer each 0 0 0 4 4 each NO BID 103.24      59.97     69.06     

Brand: Marino OR EQUAL

ID# MA1232-40G

37 Neutralizer/Conditioner Concentrate 25-1 oz. pkg, 0 10 10 12 22 cases 538.78       24.49      NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand: Walton/March NO SUBSTITUTE 6 pkgs/case 90-0.5 oz pk/tub

ID# 2 tubs/case

per oz: 0.27211  

38 Pencil Sharpeners each 0 36 36 36 72 each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand: Giant NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# M3-AP806

39 Polish, Furniture & Wood Wipes 10x12 25/tub, 0 6 6 3 9 case 58.45      NO BID 21.00     NO BID

Brand: Claire OR EQUAL 6 tubs/cs 12/25 ct 6/25 ct

ID# C-974 0.19483  0.14000 

40 Roll Towels Six 8" rolls 0 85 85 75 160 cases NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand: Bay West NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID# 208

41 Rubbermaid/Brute Dolly each 0 12 12 0 12 each 22.90      22.78        18.50     27.93     

Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute OR EQUAL

ID# 2640

42 200/case 0 10 10 10 20 cases 544.80       27.24      35.98        40.00     37.42     

Brand: Hospital Specialty Maxithins OR EQUAL

ID# MT200

43 __________/case0 8 8 8 16 cases 12.54      14.44        NO BID 16.85     

Brand: Kraft OR EQUAL 500/case 500/case 500/case

ID#

Sanitary Napkins

Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags - 11 x 7 x 3-1/2 kraft



ITEM

NO.
P A C K

BOARD OF EDUCATION

DuPAGE HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 88

DuPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

PROJECT: To provide and deliver custodial supplies to Addison Trail & Willowbrook High Schools

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N

22
Floor Pads, 14" x 20"

strip surface preparation
BROWN 10/case

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE

ID#

23 Floor Pads, Brown   20/case

Brand: 3M Doodle Bug NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 8541

24 Floor Pads, White 20/case

Brand: 3M Doodle Bug NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 8440

25 Floor Pad Holder each

Brand:3M InstaLok Doodlebug NO SUBSTITUTE

ID#

26 Floor Machine Pads RED - 16" 5 pads

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

27 Floor Machine Pads WHITE - 16" 5 pads

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

28 Floor Machine Pads RED - 13" 5 pads

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

29 Floor Machine Pads WHITE - 13" 5 pads

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

30 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: LARGE 12 boxes

Brand: PRO LINK Latex NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

31 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: EX-LARGE 12 boxes

Brand: PRO LINK Latex NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

32 Gloves, Vinyl Flock-Lined Large 12 boxes

Brand: /case

ID#

33 Gloves, Vinyl Flock-Lined Ex-Large 12 boxes

Brand: /case

ID#

34 Gum Freeze 12 oz cans

Brand: 12 cans/case

ID#

35 J-Fill Glass Cleaner 2 - 84.5 oz

Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE containers

ID# /case

36 Mop Bucket, 44 qt. with wringer each

Brand: Marino OR EQUAL

ID# MA1232-40G

37 Neutralizer/Conditioner Concentrate 25-1 oz. pkg, 

Brand: Walton/March NO SUBSTITUTE 6 pkgs/case

ID#

38 Pencil Sharpeners each

Brand: Giant NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# M3-AP806

39 Polish, Furniture & Wood Wipes 10x12 25/tub,

Brand: Claire OR EQUAL 6 tubs/cs

ID# C-974

40 Roll Towels Six 8" rolls

Brand: Bay West NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID# 208

41 Rubbermaid/Brute Dolly each

Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute OR EQUAL

ID# 2640

42 200/case

Brand: Hospital Specialty Maxithins OR EQUAL

ID# MT200

43 __________/case

Brand: Kraft OR EQUAL

ID#

Sanitary Napkins

Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags - 11 x 7 x 3-1/2 kraft

HP Products Laport Pyramid Ramrod Runge Staples

102.24   NO BID 101.20   5,000.00      100.00   173.95   NO BID

10/case 10/case 10/case 10/case

21.80     NO BID 28.49     192.00         19.20     38.25     41.73     

20/case 20/case 20/case 20/case 20/case

1.0900   1.4245   0.9600   1.9125   2.0865   

21.80     NO BID 28.49     19.20     38.25     35.77     

12.69     NO BID 12.98     10.47     141.55   NO BID

73.81        6.71       NO BID 16.82     13.935   22.39     21.31     

49.70        9.94       NO BID 16.82     13.935   22.39     23.51     

43.80        7.30       NO BID 12.79     10.46     16.82     13.48     

29.20        7.30       NO BID 12.79     10.46     16.82     12.99     

853.40      42.67     NO BID NO BID 66.75     NO BID 16.15     

10/100 count 10/100pk/cs Safety Zone

0.0427   0.0668   NOT AS SPEC'D

768.06      42.67     NO BID NO BID 66.75     NO BID 6.15       

10/100 count 10/100pk/cs Safety Zone

0.0427   0.0668   NOT AS SPEC'D

415.35      27.69     NO BID 71.88     84.70     NO BID 6.15       

10/100 count 12/24count 10/100pk/cs 12/24count

0.0277   0.2496   0.0847   0.2496   

359.97      27.69     NO BID 71.88     84.70     NO BID 6.15       

10/100 count 12/24count 10/100pk/cs 12/24count

0.0277   0.2496   0.0847   0.2496   

21.45     757.20    18.93 19.98     20.00     31.67     87.80     

NO BID 59.79     NO BID NO BID NO BID 53.50     

97.37     81.49     80.95     67.00     NO BID 224.96      56.24     

35.72     NO BID NO BID 25.60     NO BID NO BID

72-1 oz pk/case

0.35556   

NO BID NO BID 934.56     12.98 26.80     NO BID NO BID

302.94      33.66     NO BID NO BID 23.00     NO BID 27.00     

2/800 ct 6/25 ct 6/25 ct

0.02104 0.15333 0.18000 

NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,867.20      17.92     NO BID NO BID

19.49     21.11     202.20     16.85     26.59     40.66     95.22     

31.75     33.33     33.94     33.47     47.46     31.86     

12.49     13.34     12.45     192.00         12.00     24.74     20.52     

500/case 500/case 500/case 500/case 500/case 500/case



ITEM

NO.
P A C K

BOARD OF EDUCATION

DuPAGE HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 88

DuPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

PROJECT: To provide and deliver custodial supplies to Addison Trail & Willowbrook High Schools

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N

22
Floor Pads, 14" x 20"

strip surface preparation
BROWN 10/case

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE

ID#

23 Floor Pads, Brown   20/case

Brand: 3M Doodle Bug NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 8541

24 Floor Pads, White 20/case

Brand: 3M Doodle Bug NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 8440

25 Floor Pad Holder each

Brand:3M InstaLok Doodlebug NO SUBSTITUTE

ID#

26 Floor Machine Pads RED - 16" 5 pads

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

27 Floor Machine Pads WHITE - 16" 5 pads

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

28 Floor Machine Pads RED - 13" 5 pads

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

29 Floor Machine Pads WHITE - 13" 5 pads

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

30 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: LARGE 12 boxes

Brand: PRO LINK Latex NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

31 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: EX-LARGE 12 boxes

Brand: PRO LINK Latex NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID#

32 Gloves, Vinyl Flock-Lined Large 12 boxes

Brand: /case

ID#

33 Gloves, Vinyl Flock-Lined Ex-Large 12 boxes

Brand: /case

ID#

34 Gum Freeze 12 oz cans

Brand: 12 cans/case

ID#

35 J-Fill Glass Cleaner 2 - 84.5 oz

Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE containers

ID# /case

36 Mop Bucket, 44 qt. with wringer each

Brand: Marino OR EQUAL

ID# MA1232-40G

37 Neutralizer/Conditioner Concentrate 25-1 oz. pkg, 

Brand: Walton/March NO SUBSTITUTE 6 pkgs/case

ID#

38 Pencil Sharpeners each

Brand: Giant NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# M3-AP806

39 Polish, Furniture & Wood Wipes 10x12 25/tub,

Brand: Claire OR EQUAL 6 tubs/cs

ID# C-974

40 Roll Towels Six 8" rolls

Brand: Bay West NO SUBSTITUTE /case

ID# 208

41 Rubbermaid/Brute Dolly each

Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute OR EQUAL

ID# 2640

42 200/case

Brand: Hospital Specialty Maxithins OR EQUAL

ID# MT200

43 __________/case

Brand: Kraft OR EQUAL

ID#

Sanitary Napkins

Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags - 11 x 7 x 3-1/2 kraft

Tri-State

Surgical
Unique Products Valdes Xpedx

NO BID NO BID NO BID 109.50   

10/case

NO BID 39.24       32.50      29.65     

20/case 20/case 20/case

1.9620     1.6250    1.4825   

NO BID 39.24       32.50      29.65     

NO BID 36.26       NO BID per carton 142.50   

per each 14.25     

sold by carton only

NO BID 24.30       22.35      17.48     

NO BID 24.30       22.35      18.76     

NO BID 17.25       NO BID 14.60     

NO BID 17.25       NO BID 14.60     

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID 20.95     

latex per dz pair

0.8729   

NO BID NO BID NO BID 20.95     

latex per dz pair

0.8729   

NO BID 19.40       24.67      24.50     

NO BID NO BID NO BID 521.88    43.49     

NO BID NO BID NO BID 132.53   

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.20     

6/25 ct

0.10133 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID 21.70       38.96 40.90     

NO BID 48.68       NO BID 42.30     

NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.40     

500/case



ITEM

NO.
P A C K DO AT

ship to

AT e+f
WB

BOARD OF EDUCATION

AmSan Calico Expert Chemical Grainger
DuPAGE HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 88

DuPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

PROJECT: To provide and deliver custodial supplies to Addison Trail & Willowbrook High Schools

TOTALI T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N

44 __________/case0 2 2 0 2 cases 23.08      18.28        20.50     NO BID

Brand: Kotex Sanibags OR EQUAL 250/case 250/case 250/case

ID#

45 4 gal/case 0 10 10 10 20 cases NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand: KUTOL NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 68809

46 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming 1,000 ml/bag 6 75 81 75 156 cases NO BID NO BID 4,212.00    27.00     NO BID

Brand: InoDerm NO SUBSTITUTE 6 bags/case

ID# 5080-FL1000

47 Sponges, Scrubbing 30/case 0 10 10 10 20 cases 35.45      NO BID NO BID 41.89     

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 74 1.1817    1.3963   

48 Sponges, MAGIC ERASER NO SUBSTITUTE 4 pads/box 0 15 15 15 30 cases 25.50      NO BID 22.15     33.96     

Brand: Proctor & Gamble MR. CLEAN 6 boxes/case

ID# PGS84925904

49 Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes 40/tub 0 12 12 12 24 cases 63.60      NO BID 45.00     12.46     

Brand: 6 tubs/case 180         240        per tub of 75

ID# (240/case) 0.35333  0.1875   0.16613 

50 Tampons, Regular 500/case 0 6 6 6 12 cases 52.26      62.28        54.00     68.34     

Brand: Tampax OR EQUAL 500/case 500/case 500/case 500/case

ID# 0.1045    0.1246      0.1080   0.1367   

51 Tissue, facial, 2 ply 100/box 0 75 75 75 150 cases 23.36      NO BID 15.70     29.82     

Brand: 30 boxes

ID# /case

52 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para 12/case 6 30 36 30 66 cases 9.30        15.88        12.50     12.09     

Brand:

ID#

53 Vacuum 0 3 3 3 6 each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand: Panasonic NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# MC-GG283

54 Vandal Mark Remover Wipes 40/tub 0 10 10 10 20 cases 59.40      NO BID NO BID 7.72/tub

Brand: 6 tubs 6/30 ct 30/tub

ID# /case 0.3300    0.25733

55 Waste Cans: Small 6 12 18 12 30 each 11.93      12.64        NO BID NO BID

 Brand: United OR EQUAL

ID# BG-26

56 Waste Cans: Blue plastic recycling 0 12 12 0 12 each 3.13        3.28          NO BID 29.16      2.43       

Brand: Rubbermaid OR EQUAL

ID# 2955-06

57 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot Rayon 24 oz. 0 24 24 24 48 each 4.12        3.94          NO BID 8.88       

Brand:

ID#

58 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot Blend/Rayon 32 oz. 0 48 48 12 60 each 5.34        7.58          NO BID 9.83       

Brand:

ID#

59 Wet Mop Handles - plastic 0 12 12 12 24 each 6.40        95.52         3.98          7.50 7.86       

Brand: Rubbermaid Invader OR EQUAL

ID#

1,165.63    4,219.66    4,327.20    943.56    

AMSAN CALICO EXPERT CHEM GRAINGER

Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags - 4 x 2-1/4 x 9

Sanitizer, Hand, foaming



ITEM

NO.
P A C K

BOARD OF EDUCATION

DuPAGE HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 88

DuPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

PROJECT: To provide and deliver custodial supplies to Addison Trail & Willowbrook High Schools

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N

44 __________/case

Brand: Kotex Sanibags OR EQUAL

ID#

45 4 gal/case

Brand: KUTOL NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 68809

46 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming 1,000 ml/bag

Brand: InoDerm NO SUBSTITUTE 6 bags/case

ID# 5080-FL1000

47 Sponges, Scrubbing 30/case

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 74

48 Sponges, MAGIC ERASER NO SUBSTITUTE 4 pads/box

Brand: Proctor & Gamble MR. CLEAN 6 boxes/case

ID# PGS84925904

49 Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes 40/tub

Brand: 6 tubs/case

ID# (240/case)

50 Tampons, Regular 500/case

Brand: Tampax OR EQUAL

ID#

51 Tissue, facial, 2 ply 100/box

Brand: 30 boxes

ID# /case

52 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para 12/case

Brand:

ID#

53 Vacuum

Brand: Panasonic NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# MC-GG283

54 Vandal Mark Remover Wipes 40/tub

Brand: 6 tubs

ID# /case

55 Waste Cans: Small

 Brand: United OR EQUAL

ID# BG-26

56 Waste Cans: Blue plastic recycling

Brand: Rubbermaid OR EQUAL

ID# 2955-06

57 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot Rayon 24 oz.

Brand:

ID#

58 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot Blend/Rayon 32 oz.

Brand:

ID#

59 Wet Mop Handles - plastic

Brand: Rubbermaid Invader OR EQUAL

ID#

Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags - 4 x 2-1/4 x 9

Sanitizer, Hand, foaming

HP Products Laport Pyramid Ramrod Runge Staples

16.85     16.94     22.38       11.19     33.00     NO BID NO BID

250/case 250/case 250/case 250/case

55.62     NO BID NO BID 1,008.00      50.40     NO BID NO BID

NO BID 22.70     29.98     27.50     NO BID NO BID

error on their part: will replace 

cannot provide at dispenser

that price

32.31     NO BID 29.89     30.63     40.23     576.00      28.80     

20/cs

1.0770   1.4945   1.0210   1.3410   0.9600   

21.80     32.89     22.98     22.00     21.84     53.43     

40.69     NO BID 45.95     900.00         37.50     30/tub 45.57     84.72     

240        6/30 count 240        6 tubs/cs 180        240        

0.16954 0.25528 0.15625 0.25317 0.35300 

53.25     57.50     54.98     49.90     56.52     342.60      28.55     

500/case 500/case 500/case 500/case 500/case 500/case

0.1065   0.1150   0.1100   0.0998   0.1130   0.0571   

15.51     14.15     16.59     15.70     15.18     17.86     

13.59     9.69       613.14     9.29       10.00     12.76     12.38     

NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,320.00      220.00   NO BID NO BID

53.17     NO BID 51.55     900.00         45.00     50.91     64.06     

6/40 cnt 6/30 count 6/40 count 6/30 cnt 6/40 cnt

0.2215   0.2864   0.1875   0.2828   0.2669   

11.05     NO BID 10.48     15.00     NO BID 136.50      4.55       

3.53       3.06       5.27       3.65       4.63       4.93       

3.88       4.79       4.24       3.80       NO BID 9.12       

7.19       5.33       233.40     3.89       3.90       NO BID 12.31     

6.30       4.64       6.29       6.00       13.99     10.56     

5,671.83   1,337.68 2,082.86  18,939.45    710.78      1,280.06   

HP PRODUCTS LAPORT PYRAMID RAMROD RUNGE STAPLES



ITEM

NO.
P A C K

BOARD OF EDUCATION

DuPAGE HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 88

DuPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

PROJECT: To provide and deliver custodial supplies to Addison Trail & Willowbrook High Schools

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N

44 __________/case

Brand: Kotex Sanibags OR EQUAL

ID#

45 4 gal/case

Brand: KUTOL NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 68809

46 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming 1,000 ml/bag

Brand: InoDerm NO SUBSTITUTE 6 bags/case

ID# 5080-FL1000

47 Sponges, Scrubbing 30/case

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# 74

48 Sponges, MAGIC ERASER NO SUBSTITUTE 4 pads/box

Brand: Proctor & Gamble MR. CLEAN 6 boxes/case

ID# PGS84925904

49 Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes 40/tub

Brand: 6 tubs/case

ID# (240/case)

50 Tampons, Regular 500/case

Brand: Tampax OR EQUAL

ID#

51 Tissue, facial, 2 ply 100/box

Brand: 30 boxes

ID# /case

52 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para 12/case

Brand:

ID#

53 Vacuum

Brand: Panasonic NO SUBSTITUTE

ID# MC-GG283

54 Vandal Mark Remover Wipes 40/tub

Brand: 6 tubs

ID# /case

55 Waste Cans: Small

 Brand: United OR EQUAL

ID# BG-26

56 Waste Cans: Blue plastic recycling

Brand: Rubbermaid OR EQUAL

ID# 2955-06

57 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot Rayon 24 oz.

Brand:

ID#

58 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot Blend/Rayon 32 oz.

Brand:

ID#

59 Wet Mop Handles - plastic

Brand: Rubbermaid Invader OR EQUAL

ID#

Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags - 4 x 2-1/4 x 9

Sanitizer, Hand, foaming

Tri-State

Surgical
Unique Products Valdes Xpedx

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID 56.65       NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID 39.52       NO BID 32.85     

20/cs

1.3173     1.6425   

NO BID 22.40       651.90       21.73      22.30     

NO BID 46.74       44.00      43.20     

240          240         240        

0.19475   0.18333  0.18000 

NO BID 57.98       NO BID 58.30     

500/case 500/case

0.1160     0.1166   

1,873.50    12.49    16.15       14.99      17.80     

NO BID 10.62       14.65      32.85     

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID 59.98 52.20       NO BID 52.05     

6/40 cnt 6/30 cnt 6/40 cnt

0.2499 0.2900     0.2169   

NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.27     

NO BID 5.02         NO BID 5.52       

NO BID 5.85         NO BID 174.72    3.64       

sold by pk

of 12 only

NO BID 7.25         NO BID 4.32       

sold by pk

of 12 only

NO BID 8.96         NO BID 6.26       

sold by pk

Rubbermaid 14.38       of 12 only

1,873.50    803.88      13,667.33  696.60    

TRI-STATE UNIQUE VALDES XPEDX

SURGICAL PRODUCTS


