
 Desktops and Monitors Opened Friday May 31, 2019 @ 2:30pm

 Vendor Quantity Unit Price Total

The Horus Group 32 Item # 1 $711.04 $22,753.28
Rowlett, TX 32 Item # 2 $129.90 $4,156.80

Arcutek Coporation 32 Item # 1 $742.99 $23,776.19
Chicago, IL 32 Item # 2 $139.99 $4,479.68

Mesa Electronics 32 Item # 1 $794.22 $25,415.04
Lombard, IL 32 Item # 2 $122.72 $3,927.04

New Tech Solutions 32 Item # 1 $757.05 $24,225.60
Fremont, CA 32 Item # 2 $260.37 $8,331.84

Adorama Inc 32 Item # 1 NO BID NO BID
New York, NY 32 Item # 2 $118.00 $3,776.00

Computers on the Move 32 Item # 1 $728.34 $23,306.88
Glendale, WI 32 Item # 2 $111.20 $3,558.40

Tallgrass Systems LTD 32 Item # 1 $738.00 $23,616.00
Orland Park, IL 32 Item # 2 $119.50 $3,824.00

Mvation Worlwide Inc 32 Item # 1 $858.58 $27,474.56
Glen Cove, NY 32 Item # 2 $129.29 $4,137.28

AKA Comp Solutions 32 Item # 1 $731.18 $23,397.76
Chicago, IL 32 Item # 2 $114.08 $3,650.56

B & H Photo & Electronics 32 Item # 1 NO BID NO BID
New York, NY 32 Item # 2 $17.99 $575.68

Howard Technology Solutions 32 Item # 1 $746.00 $23,872.00
Laurel, MS 32 Item # 2 $145.00 $4,640.00

Y & S Technologies 32 Item # 1 $749.00 $23,968.00
Brooklyn, NY 32 Item # 2 $125.00 $4,000.00

Item # 1 Desktops: Lenovo 10SU8L100                                              
Item # 2 Monitors: HP ProDisplay P240VA 23.8"                            
GX90M44578                                        
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