Copy Paper Opened Tuesday April 30, 2019 @ 11:00am

M p Veritiv Contract P
. urane Paper . . ontract Paper
Quill P Midland Paper Operating d
Company Group Inc.
Company
Lincolnshire, IL Elmhurst, IL Wheeling, IL Addison, IL Uniontown, OH
Item #1 Addison Trail High School Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Xerographic Paper (10 Reams per case)
Non-Recycled
Virgin White; 8 1/2" x 11", 20#
Minimum Brightness 92 .
500 Type 2 Bond o better No Bid $27.07 $13,535.00 $25.59 $12,795.75 $27.90 $13,950.00 $25.44 $12,720.00
Smoothness 150-160
Caliper 3.9-4.0
Opacity 88-90
Brand: Brand: Alma Brand: Natural Choice Brand: Comet Brand: Natural Choice
Item #2 Addison Trail High School Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Virgin Colored;8 1/2" x 11";20# -Please
advise available colors
Type 2 Bond or better .
300 y"Ca"per 3.9-4.0 No Bid $35.94 $10,782.00 $36.63 $10,989.00 $36.90 $11,070.00 $36.98 $11,094.00
Opacity 88-90
Mixed Colors
Brand: Brand: Murpaco Brand: Xcell Brand: Amerlcan Eagle Brand: Premium Colors/
Premium Colors Eaual
Item #4 Willowbrook High School Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Xerographic Paper (10 Reams per case)
Non-Recycled
Virgin White; 8 1/2" x 11", 20#
Minimum Brightness 92 .
850 Type 2 Bond or better No Bid $27.07 $23,009.50 $25.59 $21,752.78 $28.00 $23,800.00 $25.44 $21,624.00
Smoothness 150-160
Caliper 3.9-4.0
Opacity 88-90
Brand: Brand: Alma Brand: Natural Choice Brand: Comet Brand: Natural Choice
Item #5 Willowbrook High School Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Virgin Colored;8 1/2" x 11";20# -Please
advise available colors
Type 2 Bond or better .
250 N aliper 3940 No Bid $35.94 $8,985.00 $36.63 $9,157.50 $36.90 $9,225.00 $36.98 $9,245.00
Opacity 88-90
Mixed Colors
Brand: Brand: Murpaco Brand: Xcell Brand: Amerlcan Eagle Brand: Premium Colors/
Premium Colors Eaual
Total: No Bid $56,311.50 $54,695.03 $58,045.00 $54,683.00
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