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Item #1 - Shirts Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

S 0 2.19 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

M 800 2.19 1,752.00 3.31 2,648.00 2.13 1,704.00 4.75 3,800.00 3.10 2,480.00 3.24 2,592.00 No Bid

L 500 2.19 1,095.00 3.31 1,655.00 2.13 1,065.00 4.75 2,375.00 3.10 1,550.00 3.24 1,620.00 No Bid

XL 100 2.19 219.00 3.31 331.00 2.13 213.00 4.75 475.00 3.10 310.00 3.24 324.00 No Bid

XXL 0 4.04 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

XXXL 0 4.04 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

Item #2 - Shorts 

S 300 5.30 1,590.00 7.40 2,220.00 5.47 1,641.00 7.32 2,196.00 5.70 1,710.00 6.88 2,064.00 No Bid

M 500 5.30 2,650.00 7.40 3,700.00 5.47 2,735.00 7.32 3,660.00 5.70 2,850.00 6.88 3,440.00 No Bid

L 100 5.30 530.00 7.40 740.00 5.47 547.00 7.32 732.00 5.70 570.00 6.88 688.00 No Bid

XL 0 5.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

XXL 48 5.30 254.40 8.62 413.76 7.47 358.56 8.32 399.36 5.70 273.60 7.88 378.24 No Bid

XXXL 0 7.15 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

Item #3 - Sweatpants

S 0 8.35 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

M 25 8.35 208.75 7.68 192.00 8.11 202.75 14.50 362.50 9.75 243.75 9.98 249.50 No Bid

L 0 8.35 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

XL 0 8.35 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

Bid Summary - PE Uniform Bid Opening Friday, March 8, 2019  @ 1:00 p.m.
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Bid Summary - PE Uniform Bid Opening Friday, March 8, 2019  @ 1:00 p.m.

Item #5 - Shirts
S 100 2.19 219.00 3.31 331.00 2.13 213.00 4.75 475.00 3.10 310.00 3.47 347.00 No Bid

M 200 2.19 438.00 3.31 662.00 2.13 426.00 4.75 950.00 3.10 620.00 3.47 694.00 No Bid

L 200 2.19 438.00 3.31 662.00 2.13 426.00 4.75 950.00 3.10 620.00 3.47 694.00 No Bid

XL 100 2.19 219.00 3.31 331.00 2.13 213.00 4.75 475.00 3.10 310.00 3.47 347.00 No Bid

XXL 15 4.04 60.60 4.90 73.50 0.00 4.75 71.25 5.00 75.00 5.50 82.50 No Bid

XXXL 10 4.04 40.40 6.28 62.80 0.00 4.75 47.50 5.00 50.00 7.00 70.00 No Bid

Item #6 - Shorts

S 100 5.30 530.00 7.40 740.00 5.47 547.00 7.32 732.00 5.70 570.00 7.22 722.00 No Bid

M 100 5.30 530.00 7.40 740.00 5.47 547.00 7.32 732.00 5.70 570.00 7.22 722.00 No Bid

L 200 5.30 1,060.00 7.40 1,480.00 5.47 1,094.00 7.32 1,464.00 5.70 1,140.00 7.22 1,444.00 No Bid

XL 0 5.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

XXL 10 5.30 53.00 8.62 86.20 7.71 77.10 7.32 73.20 5.70 57.00 8.50 85.00 No Bid

XXXL 5 7.15 35.75 10.49 52.45 7.71 38.55 7.32 36.60 7.00 35.00 9.50 47.50 No Bid

Item #7 - Yoga Pants

S 0 11.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

M 0 11.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

Lead Time 
for 

Delivery
15 Days 20 Days 15-25 Days 10-15 Days 14 Days 5-7 Days

Re-order 
time 10 Days 10 Days 10 Days 10-15 Days 7-14 Days 3-5 Days

Pricing 
held for 
full year

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

TOTAL $11,922.90 $17,120.71 $12,047.96 $20,006.41 $14,344.35 $16,610.74
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