
Chromebook Case RFP Opened Friday  April 5, 2019 @ 3:00 p.m.
Student Chromebook Cases by Gumdrop                                            
BumpTech Lenovo 100e case                                  
BumpTech HP 11A G6 EE case                                         
BumpTech Dell 5190 case        
                                           
Student Chromebook Cases by Maxcases                 
Extreme Shell Lenovo 100e case                                                                              
Extreme Shell HP 11A G6 EE cases                                                                                        
Extreme Shell Dell 5190 case                                    

Corresponding
Lenovo 

Chromebook
Cases

Corresponding
HP 

Chromebook
Cases

Corresponding
Dell Chromebook

Cases

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total 

 Vendor Quantity Quantity Quantity
Aspire Global Solutions 2200 Gumdrop $23.13 $50,886.00 2200 Gumdrop $23.13 $50,886.00 2200 Gumdrop $23.13 $50,886.00

Lombard, IL 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases No Bid

Cadence Exchange 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop No Bid

Downers Grove, IL 2000 Maxcases $30.00 $60,000.00 2000 Maxcases No Bid 2000 Maxcases $30.00 $60,000.00

Troxell Communications Inc 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop No Bid

Evergreen Park , IL 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases No Bid

AKA Comp Solutions 2200 Gumdrop $34.94 $76,868.00 2200 Gumdrop $34.94 $76,868.00 2200 Gumdrop $25.83 $56,826.00

Chicago, IL 2200 Maxcases $24.42 $53,724.00 2200 Maxcases $24.42 $53,724.00 2200 Maxcases $24.42 $53,724.00

Firefly Computers 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop No Bid

Saint Paul, MN 2200 Maxcases $25.00 $55,000.00 2200 Maxcases $25.00 $55,000.00 2200 Maxcases No Bid

SHI International Corp 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop No Bid

Somerset, NJ 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases No Bid

CDW-G 2200 Gumdrop $26.99 $59,378.00 2200 Gumdrop $26.99 $59,378.00 2200 Gumdrop $26.99 $59,378.00

Vernon Hills, IL 2200 Maxcases $19.79 $43,538.00 2200 Maxcases $19.79 $43,538.00 2200 Maxcases $19.79 $43,538.00

Y & S Technologies 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop No Bid

Brooklyn, NY 2200 Maxcases $18.49 $40,678.00 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases No Bid

RCN Technologies 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop $257.74 $567,028.00 2200 Gumdrop No Bid

Knoxville, TN 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases No Bid

Trinity Technology 2200 Gumdrop $19.50 $42,900.00 2200 Gumdrop $19.50 $42,900.00 2200 Gumdrop $19.50 $42,900.00

Saint Paul, MN 2200 Maxcases $19.99 $43,978.00 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases No Bid

COTG 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop $39.43 $86,746.00 2200 Gumdrop No Bid

Bolingbrook, IL 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases $28.12 $61,864.00 2200 Maxcases No Bid

Diltex Inc. 2200 Gumdrop $34.32 $75,504.00 2200 Gumdrop $34.32 $75,504.00 2200 Gumdrop $34.32 $75,504.00

West Covina, CA 2200 Maxcases $21.27 $46,794.00 2200 Maxcases $21.27 $46,794.00 2200 Maxcases $21.27 $46,794.00

Howard Technology Solutions 2200 Gumdrop $275.00 $605,000.00 2200 Gumdrop $275.00 $605,000.00 2200 Gumdrop $275.00 $605,000.00

Laurel, MS 2200 Maxcases $28.00 $64,400.00 2200 Maxcases $28.00 $64,400.00 2200 Maxcases $28.00 $64,400.00

IT Savvy 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop No Bid

Addison, IL 2200 Maxcases $22.85 $50,270.00 2200 Maxcases $22.85 $50,270.00 2200 Maxcases $22.85 $50,270.00

Riverside Technologies 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop $20.00 $46,000.00 2200 Gumdrop No Bid

North Sioux City, SD 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases $20.00 $46,000.00 2200 Maxcases No Bid

Sunrise Hitek 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200 Gumdrop No Bid 2200  
Substitut

Gumdrop $25.36 $55,787.00

Chicago, IL 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases No Bid 2200 Maxcases No Bid
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