
ITEM
NO. P A C K

1 Bathroom Tissue 96/case 460 cases no bid no bid no bid 28.72         28.70             no bid
Brand: National                   NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 832

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength six 1 gal. 75 cases 8.65     9.48    11.95   6.83           5.98               no bid
Brand: /case
ID#

3 each 16 each no bid 1.92    30.72        3.55     1.94           2.95               1.93     
Brand:   
ID# 

4 each 18 each no bid 4.74    6.75     4.23           76.14        3.60               4.79     
Brand:   
ID# 

5 Buckets, Janitor - 14 qt. each 24 each no bid 5.94    12.75   5.79           no bid 5.49     131.76   
Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute OR EQUAL
ID# 2614

6 Can Liners, Polyethylene 100/case   540 cases 13.40   9.84    no bid no bid 11.47             no bid
Brand:
ID# B74920K

7 Can Liners, Polyethylene 250/case 92 cases no bid 10.94  1,006.48   no bid no bid 20.02             no bid
Brand:
ID#

8 Can Liners, Polyethylene 500/case 22 cases 16.15   8.64    no bid no bid 9.11               no bid
Brand:
ID#

9 Disinfectant wipes        70/container or better 12 per case 150 cases 29.70   no bid 39.98   27.49         23.98             3,597.00   28.98   
Brand: Brand: 75/tub
ID# 6 tubs/case

0.0532/wipe
10 Dust Mop Heads w/snaps 60" 8 dozen no bid 76.18  no bid 146.28       no bid 71.76   574.08   

Brand:
ID# 560

11 Flags, American, Classroom Size: 16" x 24" 20 each no bid no bid 7.75     no bid no bid 4.98     99.60     
Brand:
ID#

12 Floor Finish 675 gallons 11.25   no bid no bid 10.48         no bid no bid
Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vect NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

13 Floor Sealer 60 gallons 15.75   no bid no bid 14.59         875.40      no bid no bid
Brand: Johnson's Wax: Plaz NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

14 Floor Stripper 30 gallons 7.75     no bid no bid 6.86           205.80      no bid no bid
Brand: Johnson's Wax: Brav NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

15 Floor Pads, 14"x20" strip surface prep - BROWN 10/case 30 cases 115.00 no bid 115.00 106.88       no bid no bid
Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 51111 025901

16 Floor Pad Holder each 12 each no bid no bid 16.30   3.56           42.72        no bid no bid
Brand: 3M InstaLok Doodleb NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

17 Floor Machine Pads STRIP PADBROWN ‐ 20" 5 pads 16 cases no bid no bid 29.04   20.90         334.40      no bid no bid
Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case
ID#

18 Floor Machine Pads WHITE - 13" 5 pads 6 cases no bid no bid 14.81   9.87           no bid no bid
Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case
ID#

19 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: LARGE 100/box 40 cases no bid 42.54  42.35   43.33         no bid no bid
Brand: PRO LINK Latex NO SUBSTITUTE 10 boxes/cs
ID# pack:__________

20 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: EX-LARGE 100/box 40 cases no bid 42.54  42.35   43.33         no bid no bid
Brand: PRO LINK Latex NO SUBSTITUTE 10 boxes/cs
ID#

21 J-Fill GLASS CLEANER 2 - 84.5 oz 12 cases 63.75   no bid no bid 57.08         684.96      no bid no bid
Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE containers
ID# /case

22 J-Fill Multi-Cleaner - Alpha PH 2 - 84.5 oz 6 cases 73.00   no bid no bid 61.67         370.02      no bid no bid
Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE containers
ID# /case

23 J-Fill Neutral Cleaner - Stride 2 - 84.5 oz 6 cases 165.00 no bid no bid 147.91       887.46      no bid no bid
Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE containers
ID# /case

.9 mil 30 x 36, 20‐30 
gallon capacity

.35 mil 22.5 x 24.5 
7‐10 gallon capacity

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 4/22/2013 @ 1:30 PM

.70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 
55 gallon capacity 

Lombard, IL Annapolis Junction, MD Glenview, IL Alsip, IL St. Louis, MO

HP ProductsCicero Mfg.Calico
Industries

Am San

Broom, Counter - 8"

Broom, Corn, Warehouse Heavy-Duty angle

5 gallon 
containers

5 gallon 
containers

5 gallon 
containers

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

Poly brush
Not as spec'd

PyramidIndustrial
Soap

Tampa, FL
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ITEM
NO. P A C K

1 Bathroom Tissue 96/case 460 cases

Brand: National                   NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 832

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength six 1 gal. 75 cases

Brand: /case
ID#

3 each 16 each

Brand:   
ID# 

4 each 18 each

Brand:   
ID# 

5 Buckets, Janitor - 14 qt. each 24 each

Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute OR EQUAL
ID# 2614

6 Can Liners, Polyethylene 100/case   540 cases

Brand:
ID# B74920K

7 Can Liners, Polyethylene 250/case 92 cases

Brand:
ID#

8 Can Liners, Polyethylene 500/case 22 cases

Brand:
ID#

9 Disinfectant wipes        70/container or better 12 per case 150 cases

Brand: Brand:
ID#

10 Dust Mop Heads w/snaps 60" 8 dozen

Brand:
ID# 560

11 Flags, American, Classroom Size: 16" x 24" 20 each

Brand:
ID#

12 Floor Finish 675 gallons

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vect NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

13 Floor Sealer 60 gallons

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Plaz NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

14 Floor Stripper 30 gallons

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Brav NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

15 Floor Pads, 14"x20" strip surface prep - BROWN 10/case 30 cases

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 51111 025901

16 Floor Pad Holder each 12 each

Brand: 3M InstaLok Doodleb NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

17 Floor Machine Pads STRIP PADBROWN ‐ 20" 5 pads 16 cases

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case
ID#

18 Floor Machine Pads WHITE - 13" 5 pads 6 cases

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case
ID#

19 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: LARGE 100/box 40 cases

Brand: PRO LINK Latex NO SUBSTITUTE 10 boxes/cs
ID# pack:__________

20 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: EX-LARGE 100/box 40 cases

Brand: PRO LINK Latex NO SUBSTITUTE 10 boxes/cs
ID#

21 J-Fill GLASS CLEANER 2 - 84.5 oz 12 cases

Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE containers
ID# /case

22 J-Fill Multi-Cleaner - Alpha PH 2 - 84.5 oz 6 cases

Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE containers
ID# /case

23 J-Fill Neutral Cleaner - Stride 2 - 84.5 oz 6 cases

Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE containers
ID# /case

.9 mil 30 x 36, 20‐30 
gallon capacity

.35 mil 22.5 x 24.5 
7‐10 gallon capacity

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 4/22/2013 @ 1:30 PM

.70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 
55 gallon capacity 

Broom, Counter - 8"

Broom, Corn, Warehouse Heavy-Duty angle

5 gallon 
containers

5 gallon 
containers

5 gallon 
containers

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

28.00   12,880.00   no bid 28.49  no bid 29.65   31.80    

5.62     no bid 5.59    419.25      6.70    11.16   8.89      

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 5.82      

4.60     no bid no bid no bid no bid 5.86      

7.90     no bid no bid no bid 12.30   11.81    

9.85     8.68    4,687.20   8.79    no bid 11.79   11.90    

12.00   no bid 12.80  no bid 11.75   19.64    

7.75     170.50        no bid 8.00    no bid 8.80     9.40      

84.90   no bid 27.24  no bid 27.14   29.75    

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

13.40   no bid 9.60    6,480.00   no bid no bid no bid

16.60   no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

8.80     no bid 7.70    no bid no bid no bid

102.00 3,060.00     no bid no bid no bid 142.20 114.67  

10.00   no bid no bid no bid 37.08   16.38    

69.85   no bid no bid no bid 34.90   28.14    

7.75     46.50          no bid no bid no bid 17.80   13.23    

42.20   1,688.00     no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

42.20   1,688.00     no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Glenview, IL Hazel Crest, IL St. Charles, IL Chicago, IL

70/container/12

Standard
Companies

UniqueExpert
Chemical

ValdesUnipakRamrod
Wooddale, IL Brooklyn, NY
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ITEM
NO. P A C K

1 Bathroom Tissue 96/case 460 cases

Brand: National                   NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 832

2 Bleach, Janitor Strength six 1 gal. 75 cases

Brand: /case
ID#

3 each 16 each

Brand:   
ID# 

4 each 18 each

Brand:   
ID# 

5 Buckets, Janitor - 14 qt. each 24 each

Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute OR EQUAL
ID# 2614

6 Can Liners, Polyethylene 100/case   540 cases

Brand:
ID# B74920K

7 Can Liners, Polyethylene 250/case 92 cases

Brand:
ID#

8 Can Liners, Polyethylene 500/case 22 cases

Brand:
ID#

9 Disinfectant wipes        70/container or better 12 per case 150 cases

Brand: Brand:
ID#

10 Dust Mop Heads w/snaps 60" 8 dozen

Brand:
ID# 560

11 Flags, American, Classroom Size: 16" x 24" 20 each

Brand:
ID#

12 Floor Finish 675 gallons

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vect NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

13 Floor Sealer 60 gallons

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Plaz NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

14 Floor Stripper 30 gallons

Brand: Johnson's Wax: Brav NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

15 Floor Pads, 14"x20" strip surface prep - BROWN 10/case 30 cases

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 51111 025901

16 Floor Pad Holder each 12 each

Brand: 3M InstaLok Doodleb NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

17 Floor Machine Pads STRIP PADBROWN ‐ 20" 5 pads 16 cases

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case
ID#

18 Floor Machine Pads WHITE - 13" 5 pads 6 cases

Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE /case
ID#

19 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: LARGE 100/box 40 cases

Brand: PRO LINK Latex NO SUBSTITUTE 10 boxes/cs
ID# pack:__________

20 Gloves, Disposable, without powder: EX-LARGE 100/box 40 cases

Brand: PRO LINK Latex NO SUBSTITUTE 10 boxes/cs
ID#

21 J-Fill GLASS CLEANER 2 - 84.5 oz 12 cases

Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE containers
ID# /case

22 J-Fill Multi-Cleaner - Alpha PH 2 - 84.5 oz 6 cases

Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE containers
ID# /case

23 J-Fill Neutral Cleaner - Stride 2 - 84.5 oz 6 cases

Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE containers
ID# /case

.9 mil 30 x 36, 20‐30 
gallon capacity

.35 mil 22.5 x 24.5 
7‐10 gallon capacity

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 4/22/2013 @ 1:30 PM

.70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 
55 gallon capacity 

Broom, Counter - 8"

Broom, Corn, Warehouse Heavy-Duty angle

5 gallon 
containers

5 gallon 
containers

5 gallon 
containers

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid 10.98      no bid no bid

12.61      10.28      11.07      a 11.48     
b 9.90       
c 8.48* *not as

d 7.48* specd

16.50      14.10      18.99      a 16.34     
b 13.32     
c 8.72* *not as

d 8.72* specd

17.34      9.30        23.40      a 11.74     
b 8.48       
c 8.42       
d 8.48       

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid  no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

Linden, NJ Lawrenceberg, TN Montgomery, NYPiscataway, NJ

Central
Poly Corp

DynaPak InterboroAll American
Poly
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ITEM
NO. P A C K

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 4/22/2013 @ 1:30 PM
Lombard, IL Annapolis Junction, MD Glenview, IL Alsip, IL St. Louis, MO

HP ProductsCicero Mfg.Calico
Industries

Am San

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

PyramidIndustrial
Soap

Tampa, FL

24 J-Fill Dispenser for 2 products each 3 each 75.00   no bid no bid 50.40         151.20      no bid no bid
Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

25 KAIBLOOEY restroom cleaner 4 gallons 50 cases 57.60   no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Brand: Kaiblooey NO SUBSTITUTE /case
ID#

26 Mop Bucket, 44 qt. with wringer each 4 each no bid 56.22  224.88      175.00 57.41         no bid 89.98   
Brand: Marino OR EQUAL
ID# MA1232-40G

27 Neutralizer/Conditioner Concentrate 72 20 cases no bid no bid no bid 26.52         40.87             no bid
Brand: Stearns NO SUBSTITUTE 72-1 oz. pkg, 144 - 1 oz
ID# /case

28 Pencil Sharpeners each 72 each no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 12.95   
Brand: Giant NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# M3-AP806

29 Polish, Furniture & Wood Wipes 10x12 25/tub, 12 case no bid no bid no bid 23.34         280.08      no bid no bid
Brand: Claire OR EQUAL 6 tubs/cs
ID# C-974

30 Roll Towels Six 8" rolls 230 cases 53.00   no bid no bid 16.26         3,739.80   no bid no bid
Brand: Bay West NO SUBSTITUTE /case
ID# 208

31 Roll Towel 8" Dispenser each 4 each no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Brand: Palmer NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 56701

32 Rubbermaid/Brute Container 55 gallon each 20 each no bid 42.48  63.85   37.08         741.60      44.49             57.95   
Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute
ID# 2655

33 500/case 20 cases no bid 13.74  no bid 13.66         12.65             12.98   
Brand: Kraft OR EQUAL
ID#

34 4 gal/case 12 cases no bid no bid no bid 54.82         657.84      no bid no bid
Brand: KUTOL NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 68809

35 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming 1,000 ml/bag 20 cases no bid no bid no bid 27.73         no bid 27.98   
Brand: InoDerm NO SUBSTITUTE 6 bags/cs

ID# 5080-FL1000

36 Sponges, Scrubbing 30/case 20 cases no bid no bid 35.55   33.79         no bid no bid
Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 74

37 Sponges, MAGIC ERASER NO SUBSTITUTE 4/box 30 cases 25.15   no bid 46.00   21.92         21.10             633.00      23.94   
Brand: Proctor & Gamble MR. CLEAN 6/case

ID# PGS84925904

38 Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes 40/tub 36 cases 53.50   no bid 77.95   43.58         43.03             no bid
Brand: 6 tubs/case
ID# (240/case)

39 Tissue, facial, 2 ply 100/box 175 cases 23.60   no bid 22.60   13.76         15.64             18.89   
Brand: 30 boxes/cs
ID#

40 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para 12/case 80 cases 9.19     735.20   no bid 17.50   13.41         9.20               9.89     
Brand:
ID#

41 Vacuum 6 each no bid no bid 212.00 1,272.00   no bid no bid no bid
Brand: Panasonic NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# MC-GG283

42 Waste Cans: 21 quart round metal: Gray 24 each no bid 9.34    20.00   8.77           210.48      no bid 9.89     
  Brand: United OR EQUAL 21 quart round metal gray or black

ID# BG-26 United bought by Rubbermaid

43 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot
100% Rayon 24 oz. 
for waxing

48 each no bid 3.94    no bid 3.54           169.92      no bid 5.99     

Brand:
ID#

44 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot
Blend/Rayon 32 oz. 
general purpose

60 each no bid 4.58    14.75   3.81           no bid 4.39     

Brand:
ID#

45 Wet Mop Handles ‐ wood handles, plastic heads 24 each no bid 4.44    10.15   3.32           79.68        no bid 5.98     
Brand: Rubbermaid Invader OR EQUAL
ID#

AmSan Calico Cicero HP Products Industrial Soap Pyramid
Total: 735.20$   Total: 1,262.08$   Total: 1,272.00$   Total: 9,507.50$    Total: 4,230.00$   Total: 805.44$  

Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags ‐ 11 x 7 x 3‐1/2 kraft

Sanitizer, Hand, foaming

OR 72 - 2 oz/pk
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ITEM
NO. P A C K

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 4/22/2013 @ 1:30 PM

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

24 J-Fill Dispenser for 2 products each 3 each

Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

25 KAIBLOOEY restroom cleaner 4 gallons 50 cases

Brand: Kaiblooey NO SUBSTITUTE /case
ID#

26 Mop Bucket, 44 qt. with wringer each 4 each

Brand: Marino OR EQUAL
ID# MA1232-40G

27 Neutralizer/Conditioner Concentrate 72 20 cases

Brand: Stearns NO SUBSTITUTE 72-1 oz. pkg,

ID# /case

28 Pencil Sharpeners each 72 each

Brand: Giant NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# M3-AP806

29 Polish, Furniture & Wood Wipes 10x12 25/tub, 12 case

Brand: Claire OR EQUAL 6 tubs/cs
ID# C-974

30 Roll Towels Six 8" rolls 230 cases

Brand: Bay West NO SUBSTITUTE /case
ID# 208

31 Roll Towel 8" Dispenser each 4 each

Brand: Palmer NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 56701

32 Rubbermaid/Brute Container 55 gallon each 20 each

Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute
ID# 2655

33 500/case 20 cases

Brand: Kraft OR EQUAL
ID#

34 4 gal/case 12 cases

Brand: KUTOL NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 68809

35 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming 1,000 ml/bag 20 cases

Brand: InoDerm NO SUBSTITUTE 6 bags/cs

ID# 5080-FL1000

36 Sponges, Scrubbing 30/case 20 cases

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 74

37 Sponges, MAGIC ERASER NO SUBSTITUTE 4/box 30 cases

Brand: Proctor & Gamble MR. CLEAN 6/case

ID# PGS84925904

38 Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes 40/tub 36 cases

Brand: 6 tubs/case
ID# (240/case)

39 Tissue, facial, 2 ply 100/box 175 cases

Brand: 30 boxes/cs
ID#

40 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para 12/case 80 cases

Brand:
ID#

41 Vacuum 6 each

Brand: Panasonic NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# MC-GG283

42 Waste Cans: 21 quart round metal: Gray 24 each

  Brand: United OR EQUAL 21 quart round metal gray or black
ID# BG-26 United bought by Rubbermaid

43 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot
100% Rayon 24 oz. 
for waxing

48 each

Brand:
ID#

44 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot
Blend/Rayon 32 oz. 
general purpose

60 each

Brand:
ID#

45 Wet Mop Handles ‐ wood handles, plastic heads 24 each

Brand: Rubbermaid Invader OR EQUAL
ID#

Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags ‐ 11 x 7 x 3‐1/2 kraft

Sanitizer, Hand, foaming

Glenview, IL Hazel Crest, IL St. Charles, IL Chicago, IL

Standard
Companies

UniqueExpert
Chemical

ValdesUnipakRamrod
Wooddale, IL Brooklyn, NY

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

56.00   no bid no bid no bid 51.60   45.73    2,286.50   

62.80   no bid no bid no bid 129.00 164.97  

27.00   no bid no bid no bid 25.98   519.60   26.96    

12.80   921.60        no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

28.00   no bid no bid no bid no bid 36.82    

19.00   no bid no bid no bid 16.99   no bid

51.00   204.00        no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

45.00   no bid no bid no bid 64.90   65.95    

12.00   no bid no bid no bid 16.99   11.39    227.80      

59.50   no bid no bid no bid 68.15   78.80    

28.90   no bid no bid 27.00  540.00   no bid no bid

28.00   560.00        no bid no bid no bid 42.70   36.36    

22.03   no bid 21.69  no bid 22.40   24.57    

40.76   1,467.36     no bid no bid no bid 46.74   51.72    

12.90   no bid 12.45  2,178.75   14.75  17.29   18.37    

15.98   

10.50   no bid no bid 14.25  12.90   14.17    

295.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 29.50    

4.29     no bid no bid no bid 7.40     5.55      

3.75     225.00        no bid no bid no bid no bid 4.75      

5.75     no bid no bid no bid 9.15     7.15      

Ramrod Unipak Valdes Expert Unique Standard
Total: 22,910.96$   Total: 4,687.20$   Total: 9,078.00$   Total: 540.00$    Total: 519.60$    Total: 2,514.30$  

Boardwalk:
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ITEM
NO. P A C K

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 4/22/2013 @ 1:30 PM

I T E M   D E S C R I P T I O N TOTAL

24 J-Fill Dispenser for 2 products each 3 each

Brand: Johnson Diversey NO SUBSTITUTE
ID#

25 KAIBLOOEY restroom cleaner 4 gallons 50 cases

Brand: Kaiblooey NO SUBSTITUTE /case
ID#

26 Mop Bucket, 44 qt. with wringer each 4 each

Brand: Marino OR EQUAL
ID# MA1232-40G

27 Neutralizer/Conditioner Concentrate 72 20 cases

Brand: Stearns NO SUBSTITUTE 72-1 oz. pkg,

ID# /case

28 Pencil Sharpeners each 72 each

Brand: Giant NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# M3-AP806

29 Polish, Furniture & Wood Wipes 10x12 25/tub, 12 case

Brand: Claire OR EQUAL 6 tubs/cs
ID# C-974

30 Roll Towels Six 8" rolls 230 cases

Brand: Bay West NO SUBSTITUTE /case
ID# 208

31 Roll Towel 8" Dispenser each 4 each

Brand: Palmer NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 56701

32 Rubbermaid/Brute Container 55 gallon each 20 each

Brand: Rubbermaid/Brute
ID# 2655

33 500/case 20 cases

Brand: Kraft OR EQUAL
ID#

34 4 gal/case 12 cases

Brand: KUTOL NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 68809

35 Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming 1,000 ml/bag 20 cases

Brand: InoDerm NO SUBSTITUTE 6 bags/cs

ID# 5080-FL1000

36 Sponges, Scrubbing 30/case 20 cases

Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# 74

37 Sponges, MAGIC ERASER NO SUBSTITUTE 4/box 30 cases

Brand: Proctor & Gamble MR. CLEAN 6/case

ID# PGS84925904

38 Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes 40/tub 36 cases

Brand: 6 tubs/case
ID# (240/case)

39 Tissue, facial, 2 ply 100/box 175 cases

Brand: 30 boxes/cs
ID#

40 Urinal Screens with block Non-Para 12/case 80 cases

Brand:
ID#

41 Vacuum 6 each

Brand: Panasonic NO SUBSTITUTE
ID# MC-GG283

42 Waste Cans: 21 quart round metal: Gray 24 each

  Brand: United OR EQUAL 21 quart round metal gray or black
ID# BG-26 United bought by Rubbermaid

43 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot
100% Rayon 24 oz. 
for waxing

48 each

Brand:
ID#

44 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot
Blend/Rayon 32 oz. 
general purpose

60 each

Brand:
ID#

45 Wet Mop Handles ‐ wood handles, plastic heads 24 each

Brand: Rubbermaid Invader OR EQUAL
ID#

Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags ‐ 11 x 7 x 3‐1/2 kraft

Sanitizer, Hand, foaming

Linden, NJ Lawrenceberg, TN Montgomery, NYPiscataway, NJ

Central
Poly Corp

DynaPak InterboroAll American
Poly

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid 145.60    no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid 64.68      no bid no bid

no bid 15.74      no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid 14.60      no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

All Am Poly Central Poly DynaPak Interboro
Total: ‐$     Total: ‐$     Total: ‐$     Total: ‐$      
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