BOARD OF EDUCATION certificates:
DuPAGE HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 88 x| x| X T x| x| x| x| x| x| x| x|
DuPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS x | x| x | x| x| x | x | X | X | X [ x |
I-Fr'ER'ﬁJECT: To provide and deliver custodial supplies to Addison Trail and Willowbrook High Schools All American Central Home Unioak Coso Lots ek Direat Yoodox Ramrod Kans HP Products/Kraft Runge Paser
o ITEM DESCRIPTION PACK Poly Poly Depot P: P Paper Sales '9e Fap
1 Absorbent, Voban, 1 Ib. bags 24 bags/ case no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid n/b n/b 37.50 33.45 39.61 nb
2 Baseboard Cleaner - 3M Trouble Shooter b b nib nb 109.44 | 1221 ozics 24.43 P21 ° 118.40 91.00 93.00 97.90 75.00
ZENEX
NOT AS SPECIFIED
3 Bathroom Tissue 96/case n/b 38.65 39.95 80{(:5 n/b n/b n/b 69.69 25.00 35.15 30.42 29.86
Georgia Pac
4 Bleach, Janitor Strength six 1 gal./case n/b n/b 13.67 6-96 oz/cs n/b 6.95 4 galics n/b 11.85 7.00 |per case 7.30 nb 5.45 |case of 4
3.037777778 PER GAL 1.74 PER GAL 1.98 | PER GAL 1.17 | PER GAL 122 | PERGAL 1.36 PER GAL
5 Bowl mop n/b n/b 3.79 brush n/b 0.70 0.56 0.62 0.49 0.50 0.53 0.75
6 Bowl Cleaner: Low acid - 9% twelve gts/case n/b n/b 2.84 32 02-26% n/b n/b 14.76 22.94 12.00 12.19 12.23 12.95
NOT AS SPECIFIED
7 Broom, Street H.D.: 16" nib nib 10.68 2/pk nib 6.72 each 8.23 |each 6.59 [each 6.73 |each 13.07 |each 6.27 |each 7.95 [18" - each
5.34 each
8  Broom Handles, Screw Type - 5' all wood 2/3" die cast n/b nib 4.15 2/pk w/brush n/b 215 1.78 2.90 2.86 n/b 2.30 2.69
2.075 each
9  Brooms, Corn - warehouse heavy duty Angle broom n/b n/b 21.36 2/pk n/b 47.80 4/case 4.54 13.43 4.45 11.13 5.74 4.34
10.68 each 11.96 each
10 __ Brooms, Floor: 24" n/b n/b 22.31 2/pk n/b 6.75 7.46 10.02 8.86 8.42 8.1 7.79
11.16 each
11 Brushes, Counter 8", Horsehair & Plastic Blended - Hardwood Handle nib nib 4.70 nib n/b 4.00 3.71 275 3.13 2.88 2.99 |plastic handle
4p  CanLiners B74920K 70 mil 43 x 48, 100/case 16.84 11.80 37.32| S6gallon- 8.97 nib 9.69 16.64 9.52 21.60 18.56 10.75
Polyethylene 2 ply, 55 gallon capacity 200/case
0.1684 each 0.19 each NOT AS SPECIFIEQ 0.0969 each 0.1664 each 0.0952 each 0.216 each 0.1856 each 0.1075 each
43 GanLiners 30 x 36, 2 ply, 20-30 gallon capacity ~ 250/case 18.36 10.20 36.47 35103/30 3:3‘ 8.59 | nib 10.23 18.90 8.88 13.75 14.98 9.80
0.07344 each| 0.0408 0.07 each NOT AS SPECIFIEQ 0.04092 each 0.0756 each 0.03552 each 0.055 each 0.05992 each 0.0392 each
14 CanLiners 22.5x 245 - 710 gallon capacity 500/case 15.96 14.10 24.91 | 1000/case | 859 nib 840 11.97 7.75 15.25 13.65 15.80 |1,000/case
Polyethylene
0.03192 each| 0.0282 | each 0.0249 each NOT AS SPECIFIEQ 0.0168 each 0.02394 each 0.0155 each 0.0305 each 0.0273 each 0.0158 each
15 Carpet Shampoo: Extraction n/b n/b 8.54 per gal - ZEP n/b n/b 21.73 |per gallon 9.86 |per gallon 5.50 |per gallon 18.96 |per gallon 8.23 |per gallon 10.75 |per gallon
NOT AS SPECIFIED
12-32 oz/cs 12-15 oz/cs 12-20z/case 12-32 ozlcs 12-20 oz/cs 12-31 ozlcs 12-18 oz/cs 12-32 oz/case
16  Carpet Spot Remover oz. can cans/case n/b n/b 70.56 384 0z/cs n/b 43.20 180 ozlcs 21.80 240 0z/cs 37.64 384 oz/cs 26.59 240 oz/cs 17.61 372 ozlcs 23.45 216 0z/cs 2215 384 oz/cs
0.18375 per ounce 0.2400 per oz. 0.09083 |per oz. 0.09802 |per oz. 0.11079 |per oz. 0.04734 |per oz 0.10856 [per oz. 0.05768 |per oz.
17__Chalk, Classroom: 12 st 72 boxes/cs n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b nb nb
/gallon /gallon Spartan|
18  Cleaner, Quaternary Germicidal Ramcide Plus n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 18.10 6.80 5.13 |Spartan 5.86 g P 8.75
dilute 2 oz/gal
dilute 2 oz/gall
19 Cleaner, Fantastic/Texize Spray 1 gt. bottles 12/case n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 39.95 34.00 n/b 34.77 43.51
20 _ Cleaner, Viking Blue Soap n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 5.10 5.16 |per gallon 5.60 [Spartan SD20 nb
21 __ Cloths, Cleaning, Treated 24 x 24 PACK n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 182.93 |500/case 70.76 Eoolcase 45.32 Eoolcase 28.58 |200/case 26.56 |100/case 39.51 [100/case
0.36586 |each 0.14152 |each 0.09064 |each 0.14290 |each 0.26560 |each 0.39510 |each
22 Disenfectant wipes 12 per case n/b n/b 87.48 7{;::: n/b n/b n/b 29.48 28.00 n/b nb 32.50
NOT AS SPECIFIED
23 _Dust Mop Treatment - All Brands - low odor n/b n/b 4.46 18 0z n/b n/b n/b 14.54 |per gallon 6.10 |per gal n/b 5.52 |per gal 14.25
37.715 per gallon
Dust Mop Frames:
24 All With Snaps 18" #518 n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 8.00 54.41 |per doz 78.24 |per dozen 44.82 |per dozen 8.50 |each
52 |each 4
25 All With Snaps 24" #524 nib n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 93.24 |per dozen 3.75 |each
26 All With Snaps 36" #536 n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 128.28 |per dozen 103.44 |per dozen nb
10.6900 8.6200 |per each
27 All With Snaps 48" #548 n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 13.17 |per each 127.86 |per dozen nb
158.04 |per dozen 10.66 |per each
28 All With Snaps 60" #560 n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 17.17 |per each 165.60 |per dozen nb
11.25 |per each 206.04 |per dozen 13.80 |per each
29 Dust Mop Handles - Swivel Snap nib nib 20.89 peggfpk nib nlb nib 6.53 8.59 6.18 |each nb
10.45 each
30 Dust Pan, H.D. Janitor 20 gauge METAL 12" edge -White #6 n/b n/b n/b n/b 3.15 3.93 |each 37.80 2.05 1.91 235 nb
31  Dust Masks, 3-M #08500 50/box, 12 boxes/case n/b n/b 205.08 2(;/1)?_{:/;/);5 n/b n/b n/b 330.00 |per case 50.00 [per case n/b nb nb
600 per case NOT AS SPECIFIED 0.5500 |each 0.0833 |each
32 Duster, Lambswool, 20" 12/case n/b n/b n/b n/b 4.95 12-;2?:/05 50.64 |per case 68.22 |per case 27.00 |per case 85.80 (20/case 31.44 |case nb
59.40 per case 4.22 |ea 5.69 |each 2.25 leach 4.29 |each 2.62 |each
33 Erasers, Finney Model 1200 12 x 2 x 2 n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 12.75 n/b 17.11 nb
34 _ Erasers, Finney Model 1800 18 x 2 x 2 n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 18.15 n/b 19.89 nb
35 _Erasers, Weber Costello #804-526 (classroom), 5" n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 1.25 n/b nb nb
36__Floor Cleaner, Gym Floor, Waterless Squeaky Clean 4X0309 n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 8.85 |per gallon 11.04 |per gallon 5.10 |per gallon 6.95 |per gallon nb
37__Floor Stripper Brand Name: Johnson's Wax: Bravo n/b n/b 8.54 per gal-ZEP n/b n/b 54.00 |per gallon 7.97 |per gallon 6.50 7.85 |per gallon 33.34 10.00 |Spartan
NOT AS SPECIFIED NOT AS SPECIFIED
38 _ Floor Finish Brand Name: Johnson's Wax: Complete n/b n/b 15.67 [ per gal-ZEP n/b n/b 67.04 |per gallon 15.39 |per gallon 8.20 9.65 |per gallon 4145 14.25 |Sgar|an
NOT AS SPECIFIED NOT AS SPECIFIED
39 Floor Sealer Brand Name: Johnson's Wax: Plaza n/b n/b 15.19 [ per gal-ZEP n/b n/b 100.67 |per gallon 16.33 |per gallon 11.75 14.90 |per gallon 67.19 13.20 [Spartan
NOT AS SPECIFIED NOT AS SPECIFIED
40 __ Floor Pads, 3M Doodle Bug #8440 White 20/case n/b n/b n/b n/b 28.95 34.36 29.98 26.40 23.97 16.30 25.50 |
| I
41 __ Floor Pads, 3M Doodle Bug #8242 Blue 20/case n/b n/b n/b | n/b 28.95 34.36 30.58 26.40 23.97 16.30 25.50 |




BOARD OF EDUCATION certificates:
DuPAGE HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 88 X T x| X x| X x| x| x| x| x| x|
DuPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS x | x| x x| x| x | x | X | X | X [ x |
I-FI'S';)JECT: To provide and deliver custodial supplies to Addison Trail and Willowbrook High Schools All American Central Home Unioak Coso Lots ek Direat oodox Ramrod Kans HP Products/Kraft Runge Paser
o ITEM DESCRIPTION PACK Poly Poly Depot P: P Paper Sales '9e Fap
| I | | | | | |
42 Floor Pads, 3M Doodle Bug Black 20/case n/b nb_ | n/b nb_ | 84.80 | 106.84 | 93.22 | 41.29 | 23.97 | 16.30 | nb_ |
[ [ [ [ [ [ [ [
Floor Machine Pads:
43 Red 13" 5 pads/case n/b n/b n/b n/b 8.50 791 13.67 7.00 7.53 6.07 10.25
44 Blue 13" 5 pads/case n/b n/b n/b n/b 8.50 791 13.67 7.00 7.53 6.07 10.25
45 Red 16" 5 pads/case n/b n/b n/b n/b 11.15 10.66 18.25 8.25 10.18 7.88 14.00
46 Blue 16" 5 pads/case n/b n/b n/b n/b 11.15 10.66 18.25 8.25 10.18 7.88 14.00
47 White 16" 5 pads/case n/b n/b n/b n/b 11.15 10.66 18.25 8.25 10.18 7.88 14.00
48 Blue 19"/20" 5 pads/case n/b n/b n/b n/b 14.75 14.11 23.99 10.90 14.57 10.71 14.00
49 Black 19"/20" 5 pads/case nib n/b 22.99 n/b 14.75 14.11 23.99 11.20 14.57 11.77 15.00 |3.00 ea
50 Glass Cleaner Brand Name: Sparkle 4 galicase n/b n/b 35.14 4/cs Windex n/b n/b n/b 40.55 |WINDEX 26.52 n/b nb 32.14
NOT AS SPECIFIED NOT AS SPECIFIED
51 Gloves:Flock-lined Latex: Medium 12 boxes/case n/b n/b 3.79 per pk-3/pk n/b 6.50 per doz 7.85 .79 |per dozen 5.00 |per case n/b 7.50 |per dozen
1.2633 each 0.54167 each 0.65417 |each 3.37917 |each 0.41667 |each 0.62500 [each
52 Gloves: Flock-lined Latex: Large 12 boxes/case n/b n/b 3.79 per pk-3/pk n/b 6.50 per doz 7.85 .79 |per dozen 5.00 |per case n/b 7.50 |per dozen
1.2633 each 0.54167 each 0.65417 |each 0.56583 |each 0.41667 |each 0.62500 [each
53 Gloves:Flock-lined Latex: Ex-Large 12 boxes/case n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b . 6.79 |per dozen 5.00 |per case n/b 7.50 |per dozen
0.65417 |each 0.56583 |each 0.41667 |each 0.62500 [each
54 Gloves, Disposable with powder ~ Large 12 boxes/case nib b 9.49 per100ctpk [ b nib 7.85 4.02 |per dozen 22.00 |per thousand|  nib 28.70 |per thousand 29.69 z'e; C;Lf;
0.0949 eah 0.65417 |each 0.3350 |each 0.0220 |each 0.0287 |each 0.02969 |each
55 Gloves, Disposable with powder ~ Ex-Large 12 boxes/case n/b n/b 9.49 per 100 ct pk n/b n/b n/b 4.02 |per dozen 22.00 |per thousand n/b 28.70 |per thousand 29.69 g'e: C:Os;
0.0949 each 0.3350 |each 0.0220 |each 0.0287 |each 0.02969 |each
56 Gloves, Disposable without powder Large 12 boxes/case nib nib 14.24 per50ctpk | nib nib nib 4.67 |per dozen 26.50 |per thousand|  n/b 28.70 |per thousand 34.00 272 C;Lf;
0.2848 each 0.3892 |each 0.0265 |each 0.0287 |each 0.03400 |each
57  Gloves, Disposable without powder Ex-Large 12 boxes/case n/b n/b 14.24 per 50 ct pk n/b n/b n/b 4.67 |per dozen 26.50 |per thousand n/b 28.70 |per thousand 34.00 g'e: coaosoe
0.2848 each 0.3892 |each 0.0265 |each 0.0287 |each 0.03400 |each
58 Gloves, Vinyl Large 12 boxes/case nib nib 10.44 per 100 ctpk | nib nib nib 6.00 |per dozen 22.00 |per thousand|  n/b 23.70 |per thousand 21.81 272 C;Lf;
0.1044 each 0.5000 |each 0.0220 |each 0.02370 |each 0.02181 |each
59  Gloves, Vinyl Ex-Large 12 boxes/case n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 6.00 |per dozen 22.00 |per thousand n/b 23.70 |per thousand 21.81 g'e: coaosoe
0.5000 |each 0.0220 |each 0.02370 |each 0.02181 |each
60 Gum Remover Freeze Mist, 12 oz. cans 12/case n/b n/b s100| foest | o 2595 | 12:6 ozlcs 20.80 36.30 24.00 38.43 20.65 |case 94.30
0.7083 per oz. 0.3604 per oz. 0.1444 |per oz. 0.2521 |per 0z. 0.1667 |per oz. 0.2669 |per oz. 0.1434 |per oz. 0.6549 |per oz.
61 Hand Cleaner, GoJo/Boraxo Waterless six_4-3/4 Ib. cans/case n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 63.10 54.72 n/b 58.02 |case 56.50
62 Mop Bucket, 44 qt. with wringer, Marino MA1232-40G each n/b n/b 47.45 35 quart n/b n/b n/b nib 61.76 n/b 89.98 102.00
NOT AS SPECIFIED
63 Neutralizer/Conditioner Concentrate -Walton March 25-1 0z. pkg., 6 pkgs/cs n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 25.75 n/b 37.55 nb
64 Pencil Sharpeners Giant M3-AP806 each n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 28.00 n/b nb nb
65 Plungers, H.D. Toilet, 8" dia. cup - Black each n/b n/b 3.91 6" n/b 6.15 6 inch n/b 10.00 5.95 n/b nb 6.83
NOT AS SPECIFIED
66 Plungers, Sink 6" dia. cup - Red each n/b n/b 2.54 n/b 6.15 6 inch n/b 6.21 3.33 n/b nb 6.83
" " _ per cs-20 0z 19 oz/can 16.5 oz/can 12.5 oz/can 20 oz/can 21 oz/can 19 oz/can
67  Polish, Lemon Furniture - Aerosol Cans 12/case n/b n/b 72.84 cans PLEDGE n/b 33.95 228 ozlcase 21.07 198 ozlcase 53.52 150 oz/case 26.93 240 oz/case 28.69 19.89 952 oz/case 33.00 228 oz/case
0.3035 per oz. 0.14890 per oz. 0.10641 per oz. 0.3568 per oz. 0.1122 per oz. 0.07893 |per oz 0.14474 |per oz
68  Roll Towels -Bay West #208 Six 8" rolls/case n/b n/b 73.95 S1czé>cTsT n/b n/b n/b 48.78 éﬂ?{iRLY 16.35 n/b 17.56 |NT 208 16.99 |Brano Towel
NOT AS SPECIFIED NOT AS SPECIFIED NOT AS SPECIFIED NOT AS SPECIFIED
69A  Roll Towel Dispenser-8" Brand Name: Palmer Fixture 56701 each n/b n/b 34.97 K‘CMI?AEF?;Y n/b n/b 69.82 28.86 33.68 n/b nb nb
NOT AS SPECIFIED
69B __Rubbermaid/Brute #2655 Container - 55 gallon each n/b 54.60 n/b n/b n/b n/b 59.74 44.99 45.20 38.78 61.00
70 Rubbermaid/Brute #2640 Doll: each nib 35.65 40.28 n/b n/b 49.20 40.33 20.28 28.88 28.90 44.54
71__Rubbermaid/Brute #2643 Container - 44 gallon each n/b 34.99 38.08 n/b 31.95 45.64 38.88 24.47 32.84 27.95 41.60
72 Rubbermaid/Brute #2614 Janitor Buckets - 14 gt. each n/b 9.10 n/b n/b 8.95 11.45 10.19 6.86 8.64 6.93 10.50
Sanitary Napkins, Hospital Specialty Maxithins MT20C 200/case n/b n/b n/b n/b 39.98 250/cs 40.54 |200/cs 43.20 |200/cs 28.70 [Rochester n/b 32.28 |200/cs 42.00 |200/cs
0.15992 each 0.20270 |each 0.21600 |each NOT AS SPECIFIED 0.16140 |each 0.2100 |each
74 __ Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags, Kraft - 11 x 7 x 3-1/2 500/case n/b n/b n/b n/b 18.83 25.24 21.36 12.00 n/b 12.20 nb
75  Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags, Sanibags, Kotex - 4 x 2-1/4 x 9 n/b n/b n/b n/b 24.41 Sx::‘aKg&?(/CS 29.98 26.68 17.00 n/b 12.64 18.78
NOT AS SPECIFIED
76 Soap, Hand, Cartridge: General Purpose nib b 5.67 per gal nb nb nib 2837 21.00 nib 28.81 nb
GoJo 1 gal
NOT AS SPECIFIED
77 Soap, Hand, Cartridge: Antiseptic nib nib 7.97 pma‘ nib n/b nib 37.99 24.80 nib 33.22 nb
NOT AS SPECIFIED
78 Sponges, Scrubbing - Scotch-Brite #74 30/case nib nib 0.79 ) /Zi’fs"‘g/':’k nib 2095 20/cs 3961 |30/cs 33.48 [30/cs 26.80 [30/cs nib 16.83 [30/case 26.98 [30/case
1.4975 each 1.3203 |each 1.1160 [each 0.8933 |each 0.5610 |each 0.8993 |each




BOARD OF EDUCATION certificates:
DuPAGE HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 88 x| x| X T x| X x| X X X x| x
DuPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS x | x| x | x| x x | x X X X [ x
I-I:ERSJECT: To provide and deliver custodial supplies to Addison Trail and Willowbrook High Schools All American Central Home Unioak Coso Lots TekDirect oodox Ramrod Kans HP Products/Kraft Runge Paser
o ITEM DESCRIPTION PACK Poly Poly Depot P: P Paper Sales '9e Fap
per ea w/
sprayer
79 Spray Bottles - 22 oz. n/b n/b 1.58 n/b 0.56 320z 0.36 0.45 0.32 n/b 0.36 0.41
24 0z ea, 3/pk
4.74/pk
80 _ Spray Bottle Trigger Sprayers n/b n/b n/b n/b 0.49 0.44 1.18 0.35 n/b 0.36 0.58
81 _Spitfire, Johnsons Wax 4 galicase n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 47.65 n/b 25.00 29.91 27.12 |12 gt/cs nb
i . per cs, 12/cs
82  Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish: ~ Aerosol Cans 12/case n/b n/b 50.14 16 on ZEP n/b 36.55 | 12-15ozlcs 2171 67.19 23.00 33.64 21.95 46.03
83 Tampax - regular 500/case n/b n/b 69.95 n/b 53.45 66.38 56.12 47.39 n/b 46.50 58.99
84 Urinal Blocks, 4 oz. - 100% Para-Dichlorobenzene nib nib n/b nib 54.09 80.65 71.78 32.88 5.70 ?;’b’;‘;"es os 53.88 69.49
68.40 |per case
85 Urinal Screens 144/case b b 15.67 1"272:; nib 895|  perdoz 11.18 218.25 85.40 9.83 89.16 187.00
188.04 per case 107.40 per case 134.16
86  Vandal Mark Remover - Aerosol Cans 12/case nib nib 165.24 1200 s | TP n/b 27.89 4362 28.00 30.86 23.67 67.75
87 Waste Cans: Large: United #2039 nib nib n/b nib n/b n/b n/b 27.06 n/b 26.40 [Witt #10 nb
NOT AS SPECIFIED
88 Waste Cans: Small: United #BW-26 n/b nib n/b nib n/b n/b n/b 10.50 n/b 9.98 [Witt #4 nb
NOT AS SPECIFIED
89 Waste Cans: Blue plastic recycling: Rubbermaid #2955-06 nib 5.99 5.08 nib n/b n/b 5.84 3.18 3.75 276 6.55
90 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot Blend/Rayon 24 oz. n/b n/b 5.38 each n/b 59.76 | per case of 12 n/b 8.50 [each 4.10 |each 6.18 [each 4.67 gzﬁhe nb
4.98 each
91 Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot Blend/Rayon 32 0z. nib nib nib nib nib nib 10.66 575 7.74 5.96 [D214 6.95 ::‘ay" 12/case
" Gold Star
92 Wet Mop Handles - White #837 n/b n/b n/b n/b 10.08 n/b 11.12 10.15 6.81 6.43 9.95
by dozen only
NOT AS SPECIFIED
93 White Board Cleaner - 1 gallon containers 4 gallons/case n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b n/b 76.00 n/b 93.52 | nb




