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Industrial

ADDISON TRAIL

1 2 AMMCO Model 4000SP Combination Disc/Drum $8,499.00

Brake Lathe Features twin cutters, boring bar, quick drum 

to rotor changeover and two spindle speeds

*NO SUBSTITUTION*

2 1 AAMCO Adapter Kit-B (AMM 900002B) $695.00

*NO SUBSTITUTION*

3 1 AAMCO Adapter Kit-A (AMM 900001A) $575.00

*NO SUBSTITUTION*

4 1 Coats Model COA775 Wheel Balancer $2,135.00

*NO SUBSTITUTION*

5 1 Hix Premier Rotary Printer Model  6c/4s Floor 

*NO SUBSTITUTION*         NO BID

6 1 Milwaukee #6480-20 Safety Panel Saw $1,139.92

*NO SUBSTITUTION*

7 1 Bosch Mastertech VCI OBD II Hardware Kit  $3,642.25

(F-00K-108-106) Diagnostic  Scantool including 

Domestic Region Subscription  (F-00E-900-062)  

& Asian Region Subscription (F-00E-900-063)

*NO SUBSTITUTION*

8 1 Branick Strut Spring Compressor (BRN-7400) $685.10

with Mobil Cart Model #744

*NO SUBSTITUTION*

9 4 Mitutoyo #103-113 Micrometer 0-1” $190.08

*NO SUBSTITUTION*

10 4 Mitutoyo #103-114 Micrometer 1-2” $209.92

*NO SUBSTITUTION*
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11 3 Mitutoyo #103-115 Micrometer 2-3” $174.51

*NO SUBSTITUTION*

12 3 Mitutoyo #103-116 Micrometer 3-4” $190.47

*NO SUBSTITUTION*

13 10 Newman Roller Frames  - MZX 23" X 26" OD Screen 

Printing Frames                                               NO BID
OR EQUAL

  Specify Mfr.  _____________________

   Mfr. Model No.  ___________________

   Cat. No.  _________________________

WILLOWBROOK

14 1 Modis-Scanner, Modular Diagnostic Information $6,309.88

Center EEMS300D14

*NO SUBSTITUTION*

15 1 Screw Extractor Kit Set, Extractor, Screw, $165.85

Multi-Spline/Spiral Flute  Left Hand Drill Bits, 35 pcs.

 (Reference Snap-On Industrial #EXD35)

OR EQUAL

  Specify Mfr.  _____________________

   Mfr. Model No.  ___________________

   Cat. No.  _________________________

16 1 Automotive Battery Charger (BC4200B)– Fast Charger $333.09

The Fast Charger is a powerful, high rate automotive 

battery charger capable of continuous charge, timed

charge and cranking assist.   Charger can charge all 6 and

 12 Volt batteries including, standard, maintenance 

free and hybrid types. 

 (Reference Snap-On #BC4200B)

OR EQUAL

  Specify Mfr.  _____________________

EEMS300G12IN
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   Mfr. Model No.  ___________________

   Cat. No.  _________________________

17 1 Spot Gun Micro Lite Kit – A/C Dye Injection for Leaks $147.95

(Reference joetoolcompany.com #UVU414500)

OR EQUAL

  Specify Mfr.  _____________________ OPTI-Lite/EZ-shot

   Mfr. Model No.  ___________________ TPD-TP8646

   Cat. No.  _________________________

18 1 SIR Tools – Air Gun Pneumatic Brake Caliper Compressor $119.20

Master Kit  (Reference Snap-On #SIRST9020) Reg

OR EQUAL

  Specify Mfr.  _____________________

   Mfr. Model No.  ___________________

   Cat. No.  _________________________

19 1 Sunnen 29-Piece ½ Inch Drive Double Deep Socket Set $104.00

SUN5153DD Metric/SAE impact Socket Set

OR EQUAL

  Specify Mfr.  _____________________

   Mfr. Model No.  ___________________

   Cat. No.  _________________________

20 2 Newman Drying Racks - Holds 20 frames for drying light                     

sensitive emulsion  Teflon coating;   Wave shelf; 

 Shelf holds  many different frame sizes; Solid sides

Easy moving heavy duty wheels.       NO BID
(Reference desmondpro.com)

OR EQUAL

  Specify Mfr.  _____________________

   Mfr. Model No.  ___________________

   Cat. No.  _________________________

21 1 5” Compact Air Angle Grinder $170.43

Sander, Air, Compact, Angle, 5" Pad/Disc

(Reference Snap-On #AT465B)

OR EQUAL
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  Specify Mfr.  _____________________

   Mfr. Model No.  ___________________

   Cat. No.  _________________________

22 1 Table Top Vacuum Casting Machine - V.I.C 9 Rio Grande $1,200.00

OR EQUAL

  Specify Mfr.  _____________________ Energy Cons.

   Mfr. Model No.  ___________________ #12408-08

   Cat. No.  _________________________

23 1 Alvin Rotatrim M12 Professional Series 12” Trimmer $259.63

(Reference dickblick.com #57113-1012)

OR EQUAL

  Specify Mfr.  _____________________ Alvin

   Mfr. Model No.  ___________________ M12T

   Cat. No.  _________________________ 390256

24 1 Alvin Rotatrim M30 Professional Series 30” Trimmer $487.49

(Reference dickblick.com #57113-1030)

OR EQUAL

  Specify Mfr.  _____________________

   Mfr. Model No.  ___________________

   Cat. No.  _________________________

25 24 Newman Roller Frames MZX 21" X 20" Screen 

Printing Frames (Custom Size)              NO BID
OR EQUAL

  Specify Mfr.  _____________________

   Mfr. Model No.  ___________________

   Cat. No.  _________________________

26 2 DeWalt ¾” Stroke, 20” Throat Variable Speed $939.36

(400-1750SPM) Scroll Saw Tool free blade change 

with 16" x 23.75" tilting table

(Reference midwesttechnology.com #DW788)

OR EQUAL

  Specify Mfr.  _____________________ DeWalt

   Mfr. Model No.  ___________________ DW788
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   Cat. No.  _________________________ DW788


